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Abstract 
The Ready-Made Garments (RMG) industry is a major contributor to the 
economy of Bangladesh, accounting for over 80% of the country’s total ex-
ports. In recent years, the industry has faced challenges due to changing glob-
al fashion trends and increasing competition from other manufacturing coun-
tries. One of the latest trends in the fashion industry is micro seasonal fa-
shion, which has significant impacts on the RMG industry of Bangladesh. The 
purpose of this study is to examine the impact of micro seasonal fashion on 
the RMG industry of Bangladesh. It will examine the changes in buyer and 
consumer behavior and demand patterns, the implications for manufacturers 
and suppliers, and the strategies adopted by industry players to adapt to this 
trend. The emergence of micro seasonal fashion has disorderly the traditional 
seasonal cycle of the fashion industry. Consumers are no longer satisfied with 
the two-season model of spring/summer and fall/winter, but instead demand 
new styles and trends every few weeks. This trend has created opportunities 
for the RMG industry of Bangladesh to cater to the fast-changing demands of 
consumers. Micro Seasonal Fashion also poses significant challenges for the 
industry. Manufacturers and suppliers must be able to produce and deliver 
garments quickly and efficiently, while ensuring high quality and sustainabil-
ity standards. This requires investments in technology, supply chain man-
agement, and training of workers. To address these challenges, industry play-
ers in Bangladesh have adopted several strategies, such as diversifying prod-
uct offerings, investing in technology and innovation, and enhancing sustai-
nability practices. These strategies have helped the industry to remain com-
petitive and meet the demands of fast-changing consumer preferences. The 
industry must be able to adapt quickly to the changing demands of consum-
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ers and invest in technology and sustainability practices to remain competi-
tive. With the right strategies and investments, the RMG industry of Bangla-
desh can control the opportunities presented by micro seasonal fashion and 
continue to be a major player in the global fashion industry. 
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1. Introduction 

Micro-seasons are a relatively new concept in the fashion industry, referring to 
the idea of dividing a fashion season into smaller, more frequent releases of new 
styles and collections. Rather than having just two main fashion seasons (spring/ 
summer and fall/winter), micro-seasons break down these traditional fashion 
cycles into smaller, more targeted releases that occur every few weeks or months. 
This micro-seasonal fashion is mainly called Fast fashion. Fast fashion is also 
known as Disposable fashion, Throwaway fashion, Quick fashion, Rapid fashion, 
Trendy fashion, Cheap fashion, Mass-produced fashion, Low-quality fashion, 
Fast-paced fashion or On-trend fashion. The concept of micro-seasons has emerged 
in response to the increasing demand for new and fresh styles, as well as the fast 
pace of social media and online shopping [1]. Micro-seasons allow fashion 
brands to release new collections and styles more frequently, responding quickly 
to changing trends and consumer preferences. This trend towards micro-seasons 
has raised concerns about the environmental impact of the fashion industry. 
With more frequent releases of new styles, there is a greater demand for produc-
tion, which can lead to increased waste and pollution. The pressure to keep up 
with micro-seasons can contribute to the exploitation of workers and the use of 
low-quality materials. Micro-seasons are becoming increasingly popular in the 
fashion industry, with many brands adopting this approach to keep up with the 
demands of modern consumers [2]. There is also a growing movement towards 
sustainable and ethical fashion, which seeks to address the negative impacts of 
fast fashion and micro-seasons on people and the planet. 

Fast fashion is a term used to describe a business model in the fashion indus-
try that emphasizes on producing inexpensive clothing quickly to meet the de-
mands of consumers. Fast fashion brands mix out new designs at an incredibly 
fast rate, often copying styles from high-end designers or trends seen on the 
runway, and then mass-producing them at a low cost [3]. This business model 
relies on rapid turnover, encouraging consumers to purchase more and more 
clothes by keeping up with the latest trends. Fast fashion brands also depend on 
the exploitation of cheap labor and the use of low-quality materials to keep pro-
duction costs low. This has led to a common concern about the environmental 
impact of fast fashion, as well as the human rights abuses associated with its 
production. Fast fashion has become a significant force in the fashion industry, 
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with many of the world’s largest clothing brands adopting this model [4]. The 
fashion industry has undergone a significant transformation in recent years, 
with the emergence of micro-seasons leading to a constant flow of new styles 
and designs. The problem is compounded by the fact that many clothing items, 
as well as other consumer goods like technology, are cheaply made and conti-
nually redesigned to keep up with the latest trends. The cycle of unconcerned 
production and endless consumption has severe environmental consequences. 
Fast fashion, in particular, has become a significant contributor to pollution, 
with the industry ranking as the second most polluting after the oil industry [5]. 
The creation of garments requires large amounts of resources such as water, chem-
icals, and land, which often go unaccounted for and contribute to the harmful 
side of fashion. Despite the widespread belief that purchasing new clothing for 
every occasion is harmless, the truth is that fast fashion has a significant envi-
ronmental cost. From production to disposal, the lifecycle of clothing items con-
tributes to pollution and other harmful impacts on the earth. It is crucial to raise 
awareness of these issues and promote sustainable and ethical fashion practices 
to mitigate the damage caused by the fashion industry [6]. 

Micro-seasonal fashion is a trend in the fashion industry that involves the in-
troduction of new collections at a faster pace, with shorter production cycles and 
smaller quantities. This trend has been gaining popularity in recent years, par-
ticularly in the RMG industry in Bangladesh [7]. The impact of micro-seasonal 
fashion on the Bangladeshi RMG industry has been significant and has brought 
about several changes in the industry. In the past, the RMG industry in Bangla-
desh focused on producing large quantities of clothing items for specific seasons. 
The industry has shifted its focus to producing. 

Bangladeshi RMG industry can be seen in several ways. It has led to the de-
velopment of new supply chain strategies and manufacturing processes. With 
shorter production cycles, manufacturers have had to adopt new technologies 
and processes that allow them to produce smaller quantities of clothing items 
quickly and efficiently [8]. Micro-seasonal fashion has also had an impact on the 
workforce in the RMG industry. With the faster pace of production, workers 
have had to adapt to new working conditions and processes. This has required 
investment in training and development of the workforce to ensure that they 
have the skills required to meet the demands of the industry. The impact of mi-
cro-seasonal fashion has also been seen in the marketing and sales strategies of the 
RMG industry in Bangladesh. With the introduction of new collections at a faster 
pace, marketing and sales strategies have had to be adapted to ensure that con-
sumers are aware of the latest fashion trends and new collections. This has re-
quired investment in digital marketing and social media to reach a wider audience. 

2. Problem Statement 

While the impact of micro-seasonal fashion on the Bangladeshi RMG industry 
has been largely positive, there are also several problems associated with this 
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trend. One of the main issues is the increased pressure on manufacturers to 
produce clothing items at a faster pace, with shorter production cycles and 
smaller quantities. This can lead to issues with quality control, as manufacturers 
may prioritize speed over quality in order to meet the demands of the industry. 
This can result in clothing items that are not up to the required standard, leading 
to dissatisfaction among consumers and damage to the reputation of the indus-
try. Another problem associated with micro-seasonal fashion is the increased 
demand for new collections and trends. This can lead to a culture of fast fashion, 
where clothing items are worn only a few times before being discarded. This can 
have a negative impact on the environment, as the production and disposal of 
clothing items can result in significant waste and pollution. The increased focus 
on micro-seasonal fashion can lead to a lack of diversity in the industry. With 
manufacturers focusing on producing clothing items that are in line with the 
latest trends, there may be less emphasis on developing unique designs and 
styles. This can lead to a homogenization of the industry, with fewer options 
available to consumers who are looking for more individualistic fashion choices. 
The increased pace of production can also have a negative impact on the work-
force in the RMG industry. With shorter production cycles, workers may be re-
quired to work longer hours or in more stressful conditions in order to meet the 
demands of the industry. This can lead to issues with worker safety and wellbe-
ing, and can also result in increased turnover rates and difficulty in retaining 
skilled workers. While micro-seasonal fashion has brought about several positive 
changes in the Bangladeshi RMG industry, there are also several problems asso-
ciated with this trend. These include issues with quality control, the negative 
impact on the environment, a lack of diversity in the industry, and potential is-
sues with worker safety and wellbeing. It is important for the industry to address 
these problems in order to ensure a sustainable and ethical future for the RMG 
industry in Bangladesh. 

3. Objectives of the Study 

• To identify the key trends and developments in the Bangladeshi RMG indus-
try, particularly in relation to micro-seasonal fashion. 

• To explore the potential impact of micro-seasonal fashion on the environ-
ment, particularly in relation to waste and pollution. 

• To examine the potential impact of micro-seasonal fashion on the workforce, 
particularly in relation to worker safety and wellbeing. 

• To evaluate the potential impact of micro-seasonal fashion on the social and 
economic sustainability of the Bangladeshi RMG industry. 

• To identify potential solutions that can help to mitigate the risks and chal-
lenges associated with micro-seasonal fashion, particularly those that arrange 
sustainability and ethical production practices. 

• To make recommendations to industry stakeholders, policymakers, and oth-
er relevant parties on how to promote a more sustainable and ethical RMG 

https://doi.org/10.4236/jtst.2023.94018


M. S. Alam et al. 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/jtst.2023.94018 262 Journal of Textile Science and Technology 
 

industry in Bangladesh, particularly in relation to micro-seasonal fashion. 

4. The Key Gaps 

There is lack of research on the long-term sustainability of micro-seasonal fa-
shion in the Bangladeshi RMG industry. While the trend towards faster produc-
tion cycles and smaller quantities may be beneficial in the short term, there is a 
need to investigate the potential long-term environmental and social impacts of 
this trend. For example, research could explore the potential for increased waste 
and pollution because of the faster pace of production and increased demand for 
new collections. The works is the need for more research on the impact of mi-
cro-seasonal fashion on worker safety and wellbeing in the RMG industry in 
Bangladesh. While some studies have explored the impact of this trend on the 
workforce, more research is needed to better understand the potential risks and 
challenges facing workers in this industry. This could include research on issues 
such as stress, fatigue, and the potential for increased accidents and injuries be-
cause of the faster pace of production. More research is essential on the role of 
technology in facilitating micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladeshi RMG in-
dustry. While some studies have explored the impact of technology on manu-
facturing processes in this industry, more research is needed to better under-
stand how technology is being used to support micro-seasonal fashion, and the 
potential risks and challenges associated with this trend. The potential study is 
required for micro-seasonal fashion to promote diversity and inclusivity in the 
RMG industry in Bangladesh. While some studies have explored the potential 
benefits of this trend in terms of promoting new and unique fashion styles, more 
research is needed to better understand how micro-seasonal fashion can be used 
to promote diversity and inclusivity in the industry. 

5. Review Motivation 

The RMG industry is a crucial sector in Bangladesh, contributing significantly to 
the country’s economy and providing employment to millions of people. It is 
important to understand the impact of new trends and developments on this 
industry, particularly those that may have potential negative consequences. The 
trend towards micro-seasonal fashion has gained significant traction in recent 
years, with many fashion brands and retailers adopting this model to keep up 
with the demands of consumers who want faster and more frequent releases of 
new clothing collections. There is a need to understand the potential impact of 
this trend on the environment, the workforce, and the long-term sustainability 
of the industry. Bangladesh is a country that is particularly at risk to the negative 
impacts of fast fashion, with concerns around worker safety and wellbeing, en-
vironmental pollution, and the social and economic sustainability of the indus-
try, there need to explore the potential risks and challenges associated with mi-
cro-seasonal fashion in this framework. 
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6. Significance and Advantages of the Study 

The research on the impact of micro-seasonal fashion on the Bangladeshi RMG 
industry is significant and carries several advantages, both for the industry and 
for society as a whole. The study will provide valuable insights into the potential 
risks and challenges associated with micro-seasonal fashion, particularly in the 
context of the Bangladeshi RMG industry. The study will help to promote sus-
tainability and ethical production practices in the industry, which is crucial for 
addressing the negative impact of fast fashion on the environment, the work-
force, and the social and economic sustainability of the industry. The study will 
help to raise awareness among consumers about the potential negative impact of 
micro-seasonal fashion on the Bangladeshi RMG industry and the environment. 
This can help to promote a more conscious and responsible consumer culture, 
where consumers make informed choices about the clothing they buy and con-
sider the social and environmental impact of their purchases. 

7. Influence of Social Media in Micro Seasonal Fashion 

Social media plays a significant role in promoting micro-seasonal fashion trends. 
Social media influencers, bloggers, and celebrities are often seen wearing the lat-
est micro-seasonal fashion trends and sharing their outfits on their platforms 
[9]. This creates a demand for fast fashion and encourages consumers to pur-
chase clothing items that are only in style for a short period. As a result, fast fa-
shion industries produce more garments to meet the demand, which contributes 
to environmental problems such as the use of harmful chemicals and the genera-
tion of waste. Some influencers are starting to promote sustainable fashion and 
encourage their followers to buy less and invest in high quality, timeless pieces. 
Social media has a significant influence on micro seasonal fashion by shaping 
consumer preferences, creating trends, and promoting fast fashion. 

Influencers are individuals who have a large following on social media and 
are often paid to promote brands and products. They can have a significant 
impact on micro seasonal fashion by displaying the latest trends and promot-
ing fast fashion. Hashtags are used on social media platforms like Instagram 
and Twitter to categorize posts and make them easier to discover [10]. Brands 
and retailers can use specific hashtags to promote their products and create 
hype around new micro seasons. Social media platforms like Facebook and In-
stagram offer targeted advertising options that allow brands and retailers to 
reach specific audiences with their micro seasonal collections. User-generated 
content is content created by social media users that feature specific products 
or brands. It can be a powerful tool for promoting micro seasonal fashion as it 
provides social proof and authenticity. Social commerce is the integration of 
social media and e-commerce. Social media platforms like Instagram and Fa-
cebook now offer shopping features that allow users to buy products directly 
from the platform, making it easier for consumers to purchase micro seasonal 
fashion items. 
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8. Literature Review 

The concept of micro-seasonal fashion has gained popularity in the RMG indus-
try in Bangladesh. The impact of micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG 
industry has highlighted several key benefits [11]. It allows industries to respond 
more quickly to changing consumer trends, as they can release new products on 
a more frequent basis [12]. Micro-seasonal fashion can help to reduce waste in 
the industry. Traditional seasonal collections often result in excess inventory; as 
unsold items are discounted or discarded at the end of the season [13]. By pro-
ducing smaller and more targeted collections, industries can reduce the amount 
of unsold stock and therefore reduce waste. Micro-seasonal fashion can help to 
improve working conditions for garment workers in Bangladesh. Traditional 
seasonal collections often require workers to work long hours under tight dead-
lines, which can lead to exploitation and unsafe working conditions [14]. By pro-
ducing smaller and more frequent collections, industries can spread the work-
load more evenly throughout the year, reducing the risk of worker exploitation. 
Some researchers have also raised concerns about the potential drawbacks of 
micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG industry [15]. The shift towards 
micro-seasonal fashion could also require industries to invest in new technolo-
gies and supply chain infrastructure, which could be costly and time-consuming. 
This could put smaller industries at a disadvantage, as they may not have the re-
sources to keep up with larger competitors. 

Much of the existing research on micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh 
RMG industry has been conducted from the perspective of the manufacturers 
and retailers, with less attention paid to the experiences of workers in the indus-
try [16]. Further research is needed to explore the impact of micro-seasonal fa-
shion on worker wages, working hours, and job security, among other issues. Pre-
vious research has primarily focused on the potential benefits of micro-seasonal 
fashion, such as reducing waste and improving responsiveness to consumer 
trends [16]. Less attention has been paid to the potential drawbacks of this ap-
proach, such as the potential for increased pressure on suppliers and workers, 
and the challenges of implementing new supply chain technologies. Present re-
search on micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG industry has been 
conducted in the context of larger industries with more resources [17]. Consi-
derable of the existing research on micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh 
RMG industry has focused on the apparel sector, with less attention paid to oth-
er sectors of the industry, such as textiles or accessories [18]. 

9. Research Questions 

The study questions of the impact of micro-seasonal fashion in the RMG indus-
try can vary depending on the specific focus of the study. The study conducted 
the current state of micro-seasonal fashion adoption in the Bangladesh RMG 
industry, and how has this changed over time. The key drivers of micro-seasonal 
fashion adoption in the Bangladesh RMG industry, and how do these differ 
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across different types of factories were considered. The benefits and drawbacks 
of micro-seasonal fashion adoption for the Bangladesh RMG industry, and how 
do these vary across were analysis in this study. Micro-seasonal fashion adoption 
impact worker wages, working conditions, and job security in the Bangladesh 
RMG industry were also analyzed. The environmental and social implications 
and how can these be mitigated; the challenges and opportunities of implementing 
and how can these be addressed; micro-seasonal fashion adoption impact the 
competitiveness of industries and how does this compare to traditional seasonal 
fashion models; the role of technology in enabling and what are the key tech-
nological challenges and opportunities were find out in this review. 

10. Findings 

Research on the impact of micro-seasonal fashion in the RMG industry has 
identified several key findings. Micro-seasonal fashion allows industries to be 
more active and responsive to changing consumer trends, which can improve 
their competitiveness in the market. By producing smaller quantities of clothing, 
micro-seasonal fashion has the potential to reduce waste in the RMG industry. 
Implementing micro-seasonal fashion requires a high level of flexibility and 
responsiveness in the supply chain, which can be challenging for some indus-
tries. The adoption of new technologies, such as data analytics and automation, 
is often necessary to enable micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG in-
dustry. There is some concern that micro-seasonal fashion may increase pres-
sure on workers, as industries may require faster production and turnaround 
times. While micro-seasonal fashion has the potential to reduce waste, it may 
also have other environmental impacts to consider, such as increased transpor-
tation and packaging. Industries that are successful in implementing micro- 
seasonal fashion often rely on detailed market research to identify trends and 
preferences among consumers. The impact of micro-seasonal fashion adoption 
can vary across different types of industries, depending on factors such as com-
pany size, market focus, and production capabilities. The micro-seasonal fashion 
has the potential to bring significant benefits to the Bangladesh RMG industry, 
but that are also challenges to be addressed. 

Studies have also identified the potential benefits of micro-seasonal fashion in 
terms of increased quickness and reduced waste, as well as the challenges of im-
plementing this approach, such as supply chain management and worker im-
pact. Recent research places more emphasis on the potential impact of micro- 
seasonal fashion on worker experiences and the environmental implications of 
this approach. Research highlights the importance of market research and tech-
nology adoption in enabling micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG 
industry, which has received less attention in prior studies [19]. The current re-
search on the impact of micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG industry 
builds on prior studies by providing a more detailed and nuanced understanding 
of the benefits and challenges of this approach, and by identifying new areas for 
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further research [18]. Micro-seasonal fashion has the potential to increase profits 
for industries by providing more options to consumers and reducing waste. This 
can lead to a stronger RMG industry and greater economic benefits for Bangla-
desh. The fast fashion industry, of which micro-seasonal fashion is a part, is 
known for its negative impact on the environment. Some may argue that the 
adoption of micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG industry should be 
discouraged due to its potential environmental impact. The fast-paced nature of 
micro-seasonal fashion can create pressure on workers to meet tight deadlines 
and produce high quantities of clothing. The adoption of micro-seasonal fashion 
can lead to innovation and technological advancement in the Bangladesh RMG 
industry, which can improve the competitiveness of the industry as a whole. The 
adoption of micro-seasonal fashion is driven by changing consumer preferences 
for more frequent and varied clothing options. Some may argue that the indus-
try should adapt to these preferences in order to remain relevant and competi-
tive. 

11. Micro Season Impact on RMG business 

Fast fashion trends lead to a need for faster production times and lower prices. 
This means that industries are under pressure to produce garments quickly and 
cheaply, often leading to poor working conditions for workers in the RMG in-
dustry. This has been a major issue in Bangladesh, where worker exploitation 
and unsafe working conditions have been reported in the past. The fast fashion 
industry tends to prioritize trends over quality and longevity of garments. This 
means that consumers are often purchasing cheaply made garments that will 
only last for a few years before needing to be replaced, leading to a constant cycle 
of consumption and waste. This creates a market demand for cheap garments, 
which can be produced in countries with lower labor costs, such as Bangladesh. 
This puts pressure on Bangladeshi manufacturers to produce low-quality gar-
ments at a low price, which can negatively affect the reputation of the industry 
and the country as a whole. 

The demand for fast fashion can also influence the environment. The produc-
tion and disposal of garments can lead to pollution and waste, and the use of 
synthetic fabrics can release microfibers into the water supply, which can have 
harmful effects on both the environment and human health. This can lead to a 
negative perception of the Bangladesh RMG industry and a decrease in demand 
for their products. 

The adoption of micro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG industry can 
increase competition among industries, which can lead to greater innovation 
and efficiency. Micro-seasonal fashion can reduce waste in the RMG industry by 
producing clothing in smaller batches and responding more quickly to changes 
in consumer demand. Some may assume that the adoption of micro-seasonal 
fashion will lead to a greater dependence on fast fashion, which is often asso-
ciated with negative environmental and social impacts. The fast-paced nature of 
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micro-seasonal fashion can create pressure on workers to meet tight deadlines, 
which can lead to worker burnout and exploitation. The adoption of micro- 
seasonal fashion can increase demand for customization and personalization in 
clothing, which can lead to greater consumer satisfaction and loyalty. 

Micro seasonal fashion refers to the concept of introducing small and frequent 
changes in fashion trends throughout the year [20]. The RMG industry in Ban-
gladesh is a significant contributor to the country’s economy, and micro season-
al fashion is an emerging trend in this sector. 

Micro seasonal fashion introduces new trends frequently, which increases the 
demand for new designs. This trend has a positive impact on the RMG industry 
as it creates new business opportunities for manufacturers, designers, and retail-
ers. The demand for micro seasonal fashion creates an opportunity for manu-
facturers to produce garments in smaller quantities. This allows them to optim-
ize their production processes and reduce waste. As a result, the industry be-
comes more efficient, and the cost of production decreases. Micro seasonal fa-
shion enables the industry to respond quickly to changing consumer preferences. 
As trends change frequently, manufacturers and designers can quickly adapt to 
new demands and produce garments that cater to consumers’ changing prefe-
rences. The introduction of micro seasonal fashion increases competition in the 
RMG industry. As more players enter the market, manufacturers and designers 
must stay on top of the latest trends and offer unique designs to stand out. This 
creates a healthy competition that benefits the industry and consumers. Micro 
seasonal fashion allows manufacturers and retailers to better manage their in-
ventory. By producing garments in smaller quantities and responding quickly to 
changing trends, they can avoid overstocking or understocking of products. This 
reduces the risk of losses due to unsold inventory. 

12. Environmental Impact of the Micro-Seasons in Fashion 

The fast fashion industry has a significant impact on the environment, starting 
with the production of competitively made garments that require huge amounts 
of resources such as water, land, and chemicals. Cotton production, for example, 
involves the use of harmful pesticides that have been linked to serious health is-
sues [21] [22]. Even after the production process, fast fashion continues to harm 
the environment through the release of harmful chemicals and microfibers that 
end up in water systems, causing health concerns. Consumers often overlook the 
impact of fast fashion on their health and the environment, as clothing is worn 
directly on the skin and can lead to rashes and other health issues. It is impor-
tant to promote sustainable and ethical practices in the fashion industry to miti-
gate the damage caused by fast fashion. 

The fast fashion industry causes significant harm to the environment from the 
production of cheaply made garments with harmful chemicals to the huge amount 
of waste generated. The industry relies on an abundance of cotton, which is 
produced using unhealthy levels of pesticides. Garments are also dyed with 
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harmful chemicals that can cause harm even after production. The trend of fast 
fashion results in clothing only lasting about five weeks, leading to the disposal 
of 11 million pounds of garments in the US alone [23]. While many people do-
nate their clothes to thrift stores, the vast majority end up in landfills. To fight 
this, people can buy locally produced and organic products, reuse old clothes in 
creative ways, and embrace timeless fashion. 

13. How to Achieve the Micro Season Goal? 

The supply chain in Bangladesh can be improved by reducing the time taken in 
each process, eliminating bottlenecks and ensuring smooth coordination be-
tween various stakeholders. The Bangladesh garment industry can invest in ad-
vanced technology such as computer-aided design (CAD), automated cutting 
machines and other software that can improve the manufacturing process, re-
duce errors and enhance efficiency. The workforce can be trained and upskilled 
to improve their efficiency, speed and quality of work. This will reduce the time 
taken to complete the manufacturing process. The lead-time for production can 
be shortened by reducing the time taken to source materials, cutting and sewing, 
and quality control checks. This can be achieved by ensuring good relationships 
with suppliers, reducing transportation time and improving communication 
between stakeholders. The Bangladesh garment industry can adopt rapid manu-
facturing methods, which involve small batches of production and quicker tur-
naround times. This can reduce the time taken to bring a product to market, 
improve the responsiveness to consumer demands and reduce waste. 

One of the main advantages of improving port facilities is that it can signifi-
cantly reduce the lead-time for importing raw materials and exporting finished 
products. This is crucial for achieving the micro-season goal, as it requires a fast 
turnaround time for producing and delivering new collections. By reducing the 
shipment time through better port facilities, industries can respond more quick-
ly to the changing demands of consumers and retailers. Better port facilities can 
increase the capacity and efficiency of cargo handling, allowing for more fre-
quent shipments and higher volumes. This can improve the overall productivity 
and competitiveness of the industry. 

To achieve the goal of micro-seasons in the Bangladesh ready-made garments 
industry, reducing shipment time is essential. This can be achieved by imple-
menting a more efficient supply chain management system. This would involve 
better coordination and communication between suppliers, manufacturers, and 
buyers. One way to reduce shipment time is to use air freight instead of sea 
freight, as air freight is much faster. However, this can be expensive and may not 
be feasible for all types of garments. Another way to reduce shipment time is to 
establish production facilities closer to the target markets. This would help to 
reduce lead times and transportation costs. It would also enable manufacturers 
to respond quickly to changes in demand and fashion trends. Implementing new 
technologies such as 3D printing and digital printing can also help to reduce 
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production time and improve supply chain efficiency. These technologies can 
enable manufacturers to produce smaller batches of garments quickly and with 
less waste. 

14. Develop Micro Seasonal Fashion Product 

Micro-fashion designing is a growing market in the sustainable fashion industry, 
offering an alternative to fast fashion. Instead of mass production, micro-designers 
create small batches of clothing using eco-conscious and secondhand materials. 
This approach allows them to develop close relationships with their customers 
and maintain quality control over the entire production process. Micro-designers 
specialize in sustainably handmade and reworked garments, using secondhand 
materials acquired from thrift stores, donations, and repurposing. They also 
practice upcycling, zero waste, and slow fashion to create exclusive and one- 
of-a-kind items. These practices promote a sustainable supply chain and provide 
an environmentally and socially responsible alternative to fast fashion. Mi-
cro-scale fashion labels produce items in small quantities, reducing overcon-
sumption and waste. Since these businesses lack the financial resources for mass 
production, the level of waste and excess remains low. While research on mi-
cro-fashion designing is limited, its growing popularity suggests that it has the 
potential to become a significant force in the fashion industry. 

15. Interpretation 

Order quality over quantity in the production process will solve the problem. 
Manufacturers can focus on producing high-quality clothing items that are de-
signed to last longer, rather than ordering speed and quantity. This can help to 
reduce the risk of defects. Promotion of sustainable and ethical production prac-
tices will solve the problem. Manufacturers can focus on using environment 
friendly materials and production methods, as well as ensuring that workers are 
treated fairly and their rights are protected. This can help to reduce the negative 
impact of micro-seasonal fashion on the environment and the workforce. To 
address the issue of fast fashion and the negative impact on the environment, 
manufacturers can also consider alternative production models, such as circular 
fashion. This involves designing products with the intention of reuse and recy-
cling, which can help to reduce waste and promote sustainability. Addressing the 
lack of diversity in the industry, manufacturers can focus on developing unique 
and individualistic designs and styles, rather than simply following the latest 
trends. This can help to promote diversity and inclusivity in the industry and 
provide consumers with more options to choose from. Addressing the potential 
issues with worker safety and wellbeing, manufacturers can focus on providing 
better working conditions and promoting a positive work culture. These include 
ordering quality over quantity, promoting sustainable and ethical production 
practices, promoting circular fashion, developing unique and individualistic de-
signs and styles, and improving worker safety and wellbeing. By implementing 
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these solutions, the industry can move towards a more sustainable and ethical 
future. 

16. Conclusion and Future Work 

Micro seasonal fashion has a positive impact on the RMG industry in Bangla-
desh. It introduces new trends frequently, which increases demand for new de-
signs and creates new business opportunities for manufacturers, designers, and 
retailers. This trend also enables manufacturers to produce garments in smaller 
quantities, optimizing production processes and reducing waste. Additionally, it 
allows the industry to respond quickly to changing consumer preferences, in-
creases competition, and improves inventory management. These factors con-
tribute to the growth and development of the industry, making it more competi-
tive and efficient. 

Previous research has primarily focused on the impact of micro-seasonal fa-
shion on industries, with less attention paid to the experiences of workers in the 
Bangladesh RMG industry. Further research is needed to explore the impact of 
micro-seasonal fashion on worker wages, working hours, and job security, among 
other issues. While micro-seasonal fashion has the potential to reduce waste by 
producing smaller quantities of clothing, there may be other environmental im-
pacts to consider, such as increased transportation and packaging. Further re-
search is needed to explore the full environmental impact of micro-seasonal fa-
shion in the Bangladesh RMG industry. Micro-seasonal fashion requires a high 
level of flexibility and responsiveness in the supply chain, which may require the 
adoption of new technologies. Further research is needed to explore the tech-
nological challenges and opportunities of implementing micro-seasonal fashion 
in the Bangladesh RMG industry. Much of the existing research on micro-seasonal 
fashion in the Bangladesh RMG industry has focused on larger industries with 
more resources. Further research is needed to explore the potential impact of 
micro-seasonal fashion on smaller industries, which may face greater challenges 
in implementing this approach. While much of the existing research on mi-
cro-seasonal fashion in the Bangladesh RMG industry has focused on the appa-
rel sector, there are other sectors of the industry, such as textiles or accessories, 
which may also be impacted by this approach. Further research is needed to ex-
plore the potential impact of micro-seasonal fashion on these other sectors of the 
industry. While micro-seasonal fashion has the potential to improve respon-
siveness to consumer trends, there may also be social implications to consider, 
such as the potential for increased pressure on suppliers and workers. 

Further research can be conducted to understand the specific impact of micro 
seasonal fashion on the RMG industry in greater detail. This could include ana-
lyzing data on consumer demand and market trends, as well as studying the 
supply chain and production processes in the industry. It would also be benefi-
cial to examine the social and environmental implications of micro seasonal fa-
shion in the context of the RMG industry. This could include researching the 
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working conditions of laborers, the sustainability of production practices, and 
the impact on local communities. A comparative analysis of the impact of micro 
seasonal fashion in Bangladesh with other countries could be conducted. This 
would help to understand the unique characteristics of the RMG industry and 
the potential for growth and development in the future. Further research on the 
impact of micro seasonal fashion in the RMG industry could provide valuable 
insights into the opportunities and challenges faced by the industry, as well as 
the potential for sustainable growth and development in the future. 

Conflicts of Interest 

The authors declare no conflicts of interest regarding the publication of this pa-
per. 

References 
[1] Gupta, L. (2018) To Analyze the Gap between a Trends Forecast of fast Fashion and 

Slow Fashion & Highlighting Hazards of Fast Fashion towards Eco System. NIFT. 
http://14.139.111.20:7888/jspui/handle/1/743 

[2] Tesarova, E.N. and Krizanova, A. (2022) The Impact of COVID-19 on Sustainability 
and Changing Consumer Behavior in the Textile Industry. Is it Significant? Man-
agement Dynamics in the Knowledge Economy, 10, 95-105. 

[3] Ghemawat, P., Nueno, J.L. and Dailey, M. (2003) ZARA: Fast Fashion. Harvard 
Business School, Boston. 

[4] Bhardwaj, V. and Fairhurst, A. (2010) Fast Fashion: Response to Changes in the 
Fashion Industry. The International Review of Retail, Distribution and Consumer 
Research, 20, 165-173. https://doi.org/10.1080/09593960903498300 

[5] Garg, P. (2020) Introduction to Fast Fashion: Environmental Concerns and Sustai-
nability Measurements. Environmental Concerns and Sustainable Development, 2, 
409-427. https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-6358-0_18 

[6] Joergens, C. (2006) Ethical Fashion: Myth or Future Trend? Journal of Fashion 
Marketing and Management, 10, 360-371.  
https://doi.org/10.1108/13612020610679321 

[7] Islam, M.S. (2021) Ready-Made Garments Exports Earning and Its Contribution to 
Economic Growth in Bangladesh. GeoJournal, 86, 1301-1309. 
https://doi.org/10.1007/s10708-019-10131-0  

[8] Attaran, M. (2017) The Rise of 3-D Printing: The Advantages of Additive Manu-
facturing over Traditional Manufacturing. Business Horizons, 60, 677-688. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.bushor.2017.05.011 

[9] Rousso, C. and Ostroff, N.K. (2018) Fashion Forward: A Guide to Fashion Fore-
casting. Bloomsbury Publishing, New York.  

[10] Ghosh, M. (2022) Product Placement by Social Media Homefluencers during New 
Normal. South Asian Journal of Marketing, 3, 21-37. 
https://doi.org/10.1108/SAJM-05-2021-0069 

[11] Stenton, M., Kapsali, V., Blackburn, R.S. and Houghton, J.A. (2021) From Clothing 
Rations to Fast Fashion: Utilising Regenerated Protein Fibres to Alleviate Pressures 
on Mass Production. Energies, 14, Article 5654. 
https://doi.org/10.3390/en14185654 

https://doi.org/10.4236/jtst.2023.94018
http://14.139.111.20:7888/jspui/handle/1/743
https://doi.org/10.1080/09593960903498300
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-6358-0_18
https://doi.org/10.1108/13612020610679321
https://doi.org/10.1007/s10708-019-10131-0
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.bushor.2017.05.011
https://doi.org/10.1108/SAJM-05-2021-0069
https://doi.org/10.3390/en14185654


M. S. Alam et al. 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/jtst.2023.94018 272 Journal of Textile Science and Technology 
 

[12] Christopher, M., Lowson, R. and Peck, H. (2004) Creating Agile Supply Chains in 
the Fashion Industry. International Journal of Retail & Distribution Management, 
32, 367-376. https://doi.org/10.1108/09590550410546188 

[13] Dissanayake, G. and Sinha, P. (2015) An Examination of the Product Development 
Process for Fashion Remanufacturing. Resources, Conservation and Recycling, 104, 
94-102. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.resconrec.2015.09.008 

[14] Dumont, A.M. and Baret, P.V. (2017) Why Working Conditions Are a Key Issue of 
Sustainability in Agriculture? A Comparison between Agroecological, Organic and 
Conventional Vegetable Systems. Journal of Rural Studies, 56, 53-64. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jrurstud.2017.07.007 

[15] Rakib, M.A. and Adnan, A. (2015) Challenges of Ready-Made Garments Sector in 
Bangladesh: Ways to Overcome. BUFT Journal, 3, 84-85.  

[16] Andersson, N. and Lozano, D. (2021) Digital Avenues for Sustainable Clothing: A 
Qualitative Study Exploring Digitalization’s Facilitating Effects to Improve Clothing 
Companies’ Sustainability.  
https://www.diva-portal.org/smash/record.jsf?pid=diva2%3A1562588&dswid=187  

[17] Brooks, V. (2020) A Recipe for Shocking the Urban Body. Lo Squaderno-Explorations 
in Space and Society, 56, 57-60. 

[18] Aktürk, N.N. (2022) Ethical Self Formation in Slow Fashion: The Case of the Sewing 
Community on Instagram. Master’s Thesis, Middle East Technical University, An-
kara. 

[19] Nalliah, M. and Smith, J. (2021) Selling Sustainability: Applying Green, Cross-Industry 
Case Studies to “Slow Fashion”. Journal of Student Research, 10, 1-11.  
https://doi.org/10.47611/jsrhs.v10i4.2286 

[20] Skov, L. (2006) The Role of Trade Fairs in the Global Fashion Business. Current So-
ciology, 54, 764-783. https://doi.org/10.1177/0011392106066815 

[21] Chen, H.L. and Burns, L.D. (2006) Environmental Analysis of Textile Products. 
Clothing and Textiles Research Journal, 24, 248-261. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/0887302X06293065 

[22] Bakshi, A. (2003) Potential Adverse Health Effects of Genetically Modified Crops. 
Journal of Toxicology and Environmental Health, 6, 211-225. 
https://doi.org/10.1080/10937400306469 

[23] Miller, J. (2020) The Textile Industry: A Deep Look into the Environmental Impacts 
of Fast Fashion. Honors Theses.  
https://scholarworks.wmich.edu/honors_theses/3353  

 
 

https://doi.org/10.4236/jtst.2023.94018
https://doi.org/10.1108/09590550410546188
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.resconrec.2015.09.008
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jrurstud.2017.07.007
https://www.diva-portal.org/smash/record.jsf?pid=diva2%3A1562588&dswid=187
https://doi.org/10.47611/jsrhs.v10i4.2286
https://doi.org/10.1177/0011392106066815
https://doi.org/10.1177/0887302X06293065
https://doi.org/10.1080/10937400306469
https://scholarworks.wmich.edu/honors_theses/3353

	Micro Seasonal Fashion Impact in RMG Industry of Bangladesh
	Abstract
	Keywords
	1. Introduction
	2. Problem Statement
	3. Objectives of the Study
	4. The Key Gaps
	5. Review Motivation
	6. Significance and Advantages of the Study
	7. Influence of Social Media in Micro Seasonal Fashion
	8. Literature Review
	9. Research Questions
	10. Findings
	11. Micro Season Impact on RMG business
	12. Environmental Impact of the Micro-Seasons in Fashion
	13. How to Achieve the Micro Season Goal?
	14. Develop Micro Seasonal Fashion Product
	15. Interpretation
	16. Conclusion and Future Work
	Conflicts of Interest
	References

