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Abstract 
The study is focused on the effect of advertising on consumer buying beha-
vior of insurance products in Ghana. Exploratory analysis and descriptive 
statistics were used to analyze quantitative data. Data analysis was done using 
a total of 200 valid responses from actual and prospective buyers of insurance 
products. The associations between constructions and latent variables were 
investigated using structural equation modeling (SEM). The results of the 
study revealed that advertisement, consumer awareness, consumer percep-
tion, consumer perception have a significant effect on consumer buying be-
havior toward insurance products. This outcome is consistent with the body 
of research. We advise that in order for advertising to be effective, the target 
market must be thoroughly engaged in order to understand their purchasing 
habits and attitudes toward goods and services. Additionally, as consumers’ 
purchasing behavior is heavily influenced by their perception, more effort 
should be put into advertising that is perception-related. 
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1. Introduction 

Organizations today aim to survive or win the competition by reaching diverse 
audiences and implementing effective advertising about consumer preferences 
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and behaviors in this volatile business environment. The use of advertising has 
increased significantly in the 21st century as the role of advertising in helping 
organizations to inform, remind, persuade and influence the public to buy a 
product or service cannot be underestimated. There are multiple definitions of 
advertising in the world today. According to Baack et al. (2016), advertising is 
described as “any paid form of impersonal display and promotion of ideas, 
goods and/or services by a specific sponsor”. The purpose of an organization’s 
advertising is to create awareness in the minds of potential buyers through vari-
ous advertising mediums to influence purchasing behavior.  

Over the years, many companies in Ghana have diminished the role of adver-
tising in influencing consumer preferences and behavior, Mensah & Amenuvor 
(2022). Some companies spend huge sums of money to advertise their products, 
insurance companies are no exception, still complain about low sales and prod-
uct sponsorships because advertising doesn’t necessarily lead to huge sales in the 
short term, but certainly if done well, from Increases sales and profits in the long 
run. The researchers’ limited empirical research knowledge exists in an insur-
ance company in Ghana on the impact of advertising on consumer preferences 
and behavior, and this study aims to fill a gap in the literature (Agyei et al., 2020). 

A life insurance policy is a contract signed with an insurance company. In 
exchange for premium payments, the insurance company provides a one-time 
payment, called a death benefit, to the beneficiary upon the death of the insured. 
Typically, life insurance is chosen based on the owner’s needs and goals. Term 
life insurance usually provides coverage for a certain period, while permanent 
insurance, such as whole life and universal life, provides lifetime coverage. It’s 
important to note that death benefits are generally tax-free for all types of life 
insurance. The growth of the insurance market is different in different econo-
mies because the insurance market is influenced by economic, social, cultural 
and demographic factors such as per capita income, income distribution, popu-
lation size, size of the public pension system and national social security system, 
inflation, the availability of private credit and the ownership structure of insur-
ance companies (Feyen, Lester, & Rocha, 2011). In such a competitive situation, 
the existence and growth of insurance companies will depend on the satisfaction 
and perceptions of their consumers (Shubhada et al., 2013). 

Companies must have the ability to recognize the basic needs and expecta-
tions of their consumers (Sunarsi et al., 2020). This is due to the recent devel-
opment of tight competition between companies, thereby making producers be-
fore the production of a product, organize a market survey to address the needs 
and expectations of the customer through the product. According to Ambler et 
al. (2000), advertising has major influences on consumption volume of consum-
ers, as well as sales volume. How accurate is knowledge on consumers of insur-
ance products, how they buy, why they buy, and where they buy is necessary in 
influencing the right advertising medium which ensures greater return on in-
creasing advertising budget of organizations. 
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Advertising has become the gate of survival, and for most organizations with 
insurance products, gaining market share is no exception (Bajpai & Mazhar, 
2022). Therefore, the purpose of this study was to determine whether consumer 
buying behavior is the result of advertisements for insurance products in Ghana. 
As mentioned earlier, advertising affects products and is perceived to have in-
trinsic qualities that are unknown at the time of purchase. Based on the above 
discussion, the question is, how does advertising influence consumer behavior 
and preferences for insurance products? The study examines the impact of 
products and advertising on consumer buying behavior. The scope of this study 
will be limited to all consumers or potential consumers in the Kumasi Metropo-
lis. Consumers are located in three popular existing markets in the metropolis 
(Kejetia Market and Asafo Market and Adum Market respectively). 

The research will be of great benefit to the following stakeholders; Company 
or Organization: The research will help the organization to find possible meas-
ures or strategies to advertise their products and services. It will be of great in-
terest and value to marketing managers to help them sell a product or service 
and make a reasonable profit for the organization. Consumers: It will create 
brand awareness to inspire their emotions to buy the product. This particular 
study focuses on the impact of advertising on users’ purchase behavior of in-
surance products. It explores the factors that are influenced by advertising 
and ultimately influence consumer buying behavior. The research will help 
readers understand consumer behavior when purchasing insurance products 
so they can develop appropriate strategies to advertise their products in the 
best possible way. The findings of this study add to the existing body of 
knowledge on the impact of advertising on consumer buying behavior by 
providing future researchers with empirical literature sources on the same or 
similar topics. 

2. Literature Review  
2.1. The Concept of Advertising  

Advertising is a subset of the promotion mix, which is one of the four parts of 
the marketing mix, including product, price, location, and promotion. Advertis-
ing is a promotional strategy used to build product awareness in consumers’ 
minds to make purchasing decisions (Abideen & Latif, 2011). It is a communica-
tion tool used by marketers. Advertising affects the attitudes, behaviors and life-
styles of individuals. It is one of the main sources of communication tools be-
tween product producers and users. For a company’s product to become a 
well-known brand, it must invest in promotions, especially advertising (Hussain 
et al., 2008). Abideen & Latif (2011) argue that advertising has the potential to 
promote consumers’ brand choices.  

Advertising is defined by Saleem & Abideen (2011) as the communication 
process, the marketing process, the economic process, the social process, the 
public relations process or the information and persuasion process. Agbeja et al. 
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(2015) define advertising as a paid, impersonal communication through various 
media by commercial companies, non-profit organizations and individuals who 
are identified in some way in the advertising message and wish to inform or 
persuade specific member-audience. Morden, 1991 (as reported by Igani & 
Aseminachin, 2022) argues that the advertising message is to establish a basic 
awareness of a product or service in the mind of a potential consumer and to 
build knowledge about it. Advertising as a promotional strategy provides the 
primary tool for creating product awareness and moderating what potential 
consumers ultimately decide to buy (Ayanwale et al., 2005; Chukwu, Kanu, & 
Ezeabogu, 2019). Advertising is an impersonal form of payment idea, concepts, 
products or services and information are promoted through the media through 
defined behaviors (Ayanwale et al., 2005; Igani & Aseminachin, 2022). Televi-
sion advertising enables advertising messages to reach a wide variety of people 
audiences or consumers and is one of the best advertising mediums, especially 
for goods and services, organizations, ideas, etc. 

2.2. Consumer Attitude  

As mentioned earlier, consumer buying patterns evolve directly from consumer 
behavior and attitudes. Many things combine to form the behavior of any indi-
vidual. The first thing that influences and shapes consumer behavior is his cul-
ture. Culture builds a strong perception of a product in the minds of customers 
(Kim & Hall, 2015; Osei, Opata, Kankam-Kwarteng, & Ofori, 2022). According 
to Rai (2013), several national and international brands were recognized and 
held strong in their minds. These concepts are ingrained in their minds due to 
their culture, lifestyle and environment. In addition, advertising also plays a very 
important role in shaping consumer behavior. Advertisements are what moti-
vates them to buy a particular product. Advertising is also a source of trust 
building. If the consumer is looking for the quality and price of the product, he 
will be greatly induced. Buying attitudes can also be built through product eval-
uation and brand perception (Rai, 2013).  

Furthermore, Mitchell and Olson’s (1981) empirical study found that when 
their experimental results showed that they were better able to predict brand at-
titudes and behavioral intentions if their attitudes toward advertisements were 
better predictors of brand attitudes and behavioral intentions. Similarly, Shimp 
(1981) uses the view of classical conditioning that when consumers are exposed 
to advertised products, these products are depicted in a way that consumers find 
appealing or attractive (e.g., using pleasing stimuli such as music or a lovable 
character), these positive perceptions are affected over time and eventually 
transferred to the brand representing the product/advertising. 

Advertising shapes people’s behavior through cognition. Cognition is a per-
son’s perception of the information conveyed through advertising. Individuals 
observe these cognitions through senses, perception, attention, memory, rea-
soning, language, etc. The best way to attract customers is to understand the 
psychological and cognitive aspects of consumers (Jakštienė et al., 2008). 
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2.3. Consumer Perception 

A Perception Formation Model (PFM) is hypothesized to explain how an indi-
vidual’s perception of certain issues is formed, thereby influencing their beha-
vior, Lim, Dzulkifli, Osman, Mohidin, and Jamal (2020). Thus, individuals tend 
to choose information that is relevant to them, and their experience can signifi-
cantly influence the interpretation of the chosen information. Because individu-
als have different experiences and abilities to interpret information, they develop 
different perceptions even when exposed to the same stimulant. Kahan (2019) 
further explained that the norms and influences of those around individuals may 
also affect their perceptions. Consumer perception is primarily defined as the 
process by which consumers perceive marketing stimuli and organize, interpret, 
and provide meaning to them. 

2.4. Advertisement and Consumer Buying Behavior  

Consumer buying behavior focuses on how individuals decide to spend their 
precious resources (time, money, and energy) on consumption-related items 
(Prasad & Jha, 2014). This includes what they buy, why, when, where, how often 
they buy it, how often they use it, how they evaluate it after buying it and how 
that evaluation affects the future and how they deal with it.  

According to (Proctor & Kitchen, 2002), the main purpose of consumer buy-
ing behavior analysis is to explain why consumers behave in specific ways in 
specific situations. Another author argues that marketers must recognize why 
and how individuals make purchasing decisions. Armed with this information, 
marketers are able to make better strategic marketing decisions. 

Once they understand consumer buying behavior, they will be able to predict 
consumer responses to various informational and contextual cues and develop 
marketing strategies accordingly. There is no doubt that marketers who under-
stand consumer behavior have a huge competitive advantage in the marketplace 
(Chekima et al., 2016). In their book, the two authors (Schiffman et al., 2010) 
mention two factors that influence consumer decisions: risk aversion and inno-
vation. Risk aversion is a measure of the degree to which consumers need to be 
certain and certain about what they are buying. Highly risk-averse consumers 
need to be very sure of what they are buying. 

2.5. Empirical Literature Review  

According to Lema (2016), “The Influence of Media on Consumer Brand Prefe-
rence” carbonated beverage market research with reference to Coca-Cola. The 
findings suggest that there is brand preference in the carbonated beverage mar-
ket and media efforts to influence consumer preference and their brand choice. 
The study was conducted using three main variables, namely information, 
communication and understanding. This study shows that variable information 
has a strong influence on advertising in consumers’ brand preferences. Here va-
riable information is measured through three dimensions; they are attractive-
ness, attention and awareness. These three dimensions’ account for approx-
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imately 56% of respondents who are highly influenced by advertising messages 
(Vivekananthan, 2010).  

Rasul & McDowell (2012) explained in their study that as the number of TV 
channels continues to grow, the proliferation of electronic media puts pressure 
on advertisers to ensure that they are not only appearing on an increasing num-
ber of TV channels, but also in print and outdoor media. Their findings suggest 
that the advertising industry is continuing to grow at a high rate as media pres-
ence has become an issue for companies’ survival. Research shows that in addi-
tion to advertising on TV, print media has also received a lot of attention from 
advertisers. At the same time, spending in other media, including broadcast, 
out-of-home and direct marketing, has also grown in 2003 and beyond. In addi-
tion, the share of annual TV ad spending is continuing to rise at a faster rate 
than all other media. 

Lim et al. (2015) analyzed “What Works: An Empirical Generalization of the 
Brand Impact of Multimedia Campaigns”. Analysis of 39 multimedia campaigns 
shows how TV, magazine and online advertising work together to drive brand 
metrics and deliver return on spend for each medium and media mix. Their re-
search explains that all three media—TV, magazines, and the Internet—are ef-
fective in increasing consumer awareness, preferences, and purchase intentions. 
The findings suggest that TV remains a powerful medium for increasing brand 
and advertising awareness, and exposure to online advertising alongside TV is 
associated with increased levels of independent (or primary) brand awareness, 
an important measure of brand salience. These findings can serve as a bench-
mark for campaign measurement, which can help advertisers plan more efficient 
and effective campaigns for better output. In addition, Bamfo, Kraa, Asabere, & 
Atarah (2019) analyze the “attractiveness of advertising and its effectiveness”. 
They put more emphasis on conscious processing of advertising messages. The 
research identifies what drives customer interest. The findings suggest that fac-
tors such as celebrity, humor, information and music play a role in attracting 
customers. The researchers paid more attention to the medium and language 
used in advertising.  

Another study by Babatunde et al. (2012) on factors influencing Nigerian 
women’s purchasing decisions regarding cosmetics found that 54% were influ-
enced by celebrity endorsements, 14% by product price and 12% by product 
price, product packaging, and 10% were influenced by testimonials in TV com-
mercials. Research by Kumar & Ghodeswar (2015) also found that consumers 
make a decision to buy a specific product after seeing advertisements that in-
crease their level of awareness of the product, product price, product benefits, 
and product quality. The study also found that some consumers use advertising 
to compare various advertised products before making a purchasing decision. 

2.6. Conceptual Framework 

Figure 1 shows the proposed model that clearly examines the effect of advertis-
ing on consumer buying behavior. Despite the high cost, advertising has a direct 
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impact on consumers. It creates awareness among consumers, which motivates 
them to buy the product. In addition to this, ads can also build positive or nega-
tive perceptions of a brand. Our research model identifies the impact of adver-
tising on customer awareness and perception, which leads to consumers’ pur-
chasing decisions. The model first addresses the factors that may influence con-
sumer buying behavior and second it helps to use advertising for men and 
women in the right way, keeping in mind awareness and perception factors that 
will ultimately satisfy consumers’ needs and enhance their desire to buy a specif-
ic product and incentivize customers to repurchase those products. 

Hypothesis 
Five hypotheses have been developed in this research study.  
H1: There is a relationship between advertisement and consumer awareness. 
H2: There is a relationship between advertisement and consumer perception.  
H3: There is a relationship between consumer perception has impact on buy-

ing behavior. 
H4: There is a relationship between consumer awareness has impact on con-

sumer buying behavior. 

3. Materials and Methods 

This section entails methodological approaches used to derive data for the study. 
It includes the following: design, population sample size and techniques, study 
area, procedure for data instruments and analysis. 

3.1. Research Design 

Research design is a comprehensive plan, structure, or strategy for collecting da-
ta with the aim of finding answers to various research questions (Blumberg et al., 
2014). This study uses descriptive and explanatory designs to analyze the impact 
of advertising on insurance product purchase behavior among consumers in the 
Kumasi metropolitan area. The design also focuses on the characterization of 
object groups, such as who, what, when, and who. The descriptive survey design 

 

 
Figure 1. The research model. 
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used in this study is suitable for this study because it enables the researcher to 
describe the situation, topic, behavior, or phenomenon under investigation with-
out affecting the research environment. 

3.2. Data Collection 

To gain insight into the impact of advertising on insurance product purchase 
behavior among consumers in the Kumasi metropolitan area, we collected data 
using a structured questionnaire (Das et al., 2019). The measures of consumer 
purchasing behavior were adapted from Hee & Yen (2018). Measures of adver-
tising were adapted from Hee & Yen (2018) and Lee et al. (2015). Measures for 
Perception variables were adopted from the study of Ackah and Owusu (2012). 
Awareness toward purchase was adapted from Owusu-Frimpong & Mmieh 
(2007). Likert scale was used to measure all the valuables. The scale was anc-
hored by 1 (Strongly disagree), 2 (Disagree), 3 (Neither agree nor disagree), 4 
(Agree) and 5 (Strongly agree). To better represent consumers or potential con-
sumers, we contacted our samples via email or social media. After initial prepa-
ration, the survey was conducted over a period of approximately one month 
from late October to late November 2021, and the questionnaire was generated 
using Google Forms (Ray et al., 2021). After a brief overview of the research 
topic, the first part of the questionnaire informs the participants about the over-
all objectives of the study and guarantees their anonymity and confidentiality 
regarding data analysis (Livingstone et al., 2015). 

3.3. Sample Description  

A total of 230 questionnaires were received in this survey. Responses are col-
lected via Google Sheets and downloaded into an Excel file. The two authors 
scanned the database for all readable values and performed logical checks on the 
assumed values of the detected variables. To verify the consistency of the an-
swers provided, descriptive analyses (means, frequency distributions, and inter-
quartile ranges) were performed using Statistical Package for Social Science 
(SPSS). This verification resulted in 30 questionnaires being omitted due to 
invalid answers or incomplete information. So we got 200 valid responses. 

3.4. Data Analysis  

To analyze the impact of advertising on consumers’ purchase behavior of insur-
ance products in the Kumasi metropolitan area, this study applies the partial 
least squares (PLS) method to structural equation modeling (SEM). PLS-SEM is 
used in various disciplines (Hair et al., 2011, 2012) and is an alternative to 
CB-SEM. This technique enables statistical analysis of proposed relationships by 
exploring and predicting dependent variables and allowing the calculation and 
quantification of the effects of certain variables on others (Hallak et al., 2018). 
PLS-SEM allows us to perform an exploratory analysis (Edmondson and McMa-
nus, 2007), followed by a predictive analysis (Hair et al., 2014) of the structure of 
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buying behavior (Ciocirlan et al., 2020). Our analysis of black box auto insurance 
is relatively new, so using PLS-SEM is a good option (Hair et al., 2014). Finally, 
PLS-SEM is estimated to be more resistant to normality bias than CB-SEM (Hair 
et al., 2011). 

Measurement Model  
The PLS-SEM method first evaluates the measurement models used to analyze 
the reliability and validity of each construct. The composite reliability, conver-
gent validity and discriminant validity of the model were tested. Internal consis-
tency was tested by Cronbach’s alpha (Hair et al., 2011) and composite reliability 
(CR). Convergent validity is an assessment of the degree to which measures of 
the same construct are positively correlated with each other, while discriminant 
validity is an assessment of the degree to which constructs are differentiated 
from each other. 

4. Demographic Characteristics of the Respondents 

The demographic profile of respondents necessary for the study is presented in 
Table 1 below. Respondents have been profiled according to gender, age and 
academic qualification. 

The demographic profile of participants that were engaged in the research 
works. The results show that out of the 200 (100%) respondents, 88 participants 
representing (43.9%) were males and 112 participants representing (56.1%) were 
females. This shows that majority of the participants were females compared to 
the males. Also, the results showed that 36 (17.9%) of the participants were up to  

 
Table 1. Demographic Characteristics of the respondents. 

Variables Categories Frequency Percent 

Gender 

Male 88 43.9 

Female 112 56.1 

Total 200 100.0 

Age 

Up to 30 yrs 36 17.9 

31 to 40 yrs 111 55.3 

41 to 50 yrs 42 21.1 

51 and Above 12 5.8 

Total 200 100.0 

Educational Background 

MSLC/JHS 20 10.0 

SSSCE 17 8.4 

Diploma 71 35.5 

Degree 88 44.2 

Post Graduate 4 1.8 

Total 200 100.0 
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30 years, 111 (55.3%) were between 31 to 40 years, 42 (21.1) of the participants 
were between 41 to 50 years and 13 (6.5) of the participants were 51 and above. 
Thus, majority of the participants were between 31 to 40 years, whilst the least 
were 51 and above. As regard the educational level of the participants shows that 
hose with MSLC/JHS as their highest educational level were 10 with a percentage 
of (10.0). SHS educational level had 17 (8.4%). Participants with diploma were 
71 (35.5%). Degree holders were 88 (44.2%) and Postgraduate level had 4 (1.8%).  

4.1. Analysis and Results of Structural Equation Modelling  

In testing the hypothesis resulting from the theoretical model, Structural Equa-
tion Modeling (SEM) was used. In this research, the two-stage approach sup-
ported by Anderson and Gerbing (1988) was adopted because the precise repre-
sentation of the reliability of each build is better carried out in two stages to pre-
vent any interaction between measurement and structural models (Hair et al., 
2010).  

4.2. Validity and Reliability  

In order to ensure the level of consistency in the measurement of the intended 
latent construct, a reliability test was carried out. As shown in Table 2 below, the 
alpha of Cronbach was used to test the reliability and the results exceeded the 
acceptable standard > 0.70, showing a high reliability for the instruments 
adopted (Nunnally, 1978).  

Composite reliability (CR) values were also greater than 0.80 with derived 
mean variance > 0.50, showing convergent validity in which measurements were 
consistent across multiple items of a single definition, and indicating that the 
structure had sufficient internal consistency (Fornell & Larcker, 1981; Hair et al., 
2012). The table above shows the details in which the reliability, factor loadings 
and mean variance of the constructs were removed. 

In order to measure the degree to which the constructs differed and to eva-
luate the freedom of measurement model of a construct from redundant objects, 
discriminant validity was also used. In particular, the measure was assumed to 
have discriminant validity if the items in a construct were more closely corre-
lated with each other than with items measuring other constructs. A scale should 
not be closely associated with the calculation of a separate construct in this light 
(Babin & Zikmund, 2016). Scholars such as Fornell and Lacker (1981) postulate 
that the AVE’s square root should be greater than the correlation between the 
construct and the other constructs, and this research is in line with this claim 
because, for each construct, all the constructs met the discriminant validity with 
the AVE greater than the square correlation with the other constructs as shown 
in the below Table 3. This is the matrix for inter-construct correlation. The cross 
loadings also revealed that items load higher on their respective constructs (i.e., 
above 0.60) than on another construct (see Table 4). No item was deleted be-
cause they all showed high loadings of above 0.60.  
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Table 2. Validity and Reliability results. 

Research constructs Cronbach’s alpha Rho_A CR AVE Loadings 

Advertising 0.886 0.893 0.916 0.686  

A1     0.830 

A2     0.802 

A3     0.823 

A4     0.855 

A5     0.832 

Consumer Awareness 0.866 0.867 0.904 0.653  

AC1     0.765 

AC2     0.751 

AC3     0.842 

AC4     0.816 

AC5     0.861 

Consumer Buying Behavior 0.850 0.859 0.893 0.626  

CBB1     0.854 

CBB2     0.786 

CBB3     0.762 

CBB4     0.814 

CBB5     0.734 

Consumer Perception 0.875 0.884 0.909 0.667  

CP1     0.751 

CP2     0.798 

CP3     0.856 

CP4     0.829 

CP5     0.845 

Source: Field data (2021). 
 

Table 3. Discriminant validity.  

  Advertising 
Consumer 
Awareness 

Consumer  
Buying Behavior 

Consumer  
Perception 

Advertising 0.828       

Consumer 
Awareness 

0.539 0.808     

Consumer  
Buying Behavior 

0.534 0.645 0.791   

Consumer  
Perception 

0.506 0.752 0.646 0.817 
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Table 4. Cross loadings.  

  Advertising 
Consumer  
Awareness 

Consumer  
Buying Behavior 

Consumer  
Perception 

A1 0.830 0.412 0.388 0.356 

A2 0.802 0.422 0.461 0.372 

A3 0.823 0.412 0.444 0.374 

A4 0.855 0.496 0.471 0.504 

A5 0.832 0.475 0.440 0.462 

AC1 0.451 0.765 0.496 0.486 

AC2 0.402 0.751 0.562 0.491 

AC3 0.418 0.842 0.514 0.668 

AC4 0.451 0.816 0.464 0.676 

AC5 0.455 0.861 0.563 0.713 

CBB1 0.453 0.624 0.854 0.597 

CBB2 0.331 0.458 0.786 0.482 

CBB3 0.428 0.449 0.762 0.457 

CBB4 0.399 0.505 0.814 0.459 

CBB5 0.490 0.489 0.734 0.537 

CP1 0.295 0.658 0.426 0.751 

CP2 0.473 0.580 0.541 0.798 

CP3 0.467 0.652 0.595 0.856 

CP4 0.377 0.592 0.513 0.829 

CP5 0.421 0.605 0.538 0.845 

4.3. Summary of the Hypothesized Relationships  

The summary of the hypothesized relationships was done according to the con-
ceptual model presented in the path diagram analysis in Figure 2. As well as 
outcome from Table 5 shows that advertising (β = 0.539, t = 9.147, p = 0.000) 
was found to have a significantly positive effect on consumer awareness, thus 
supported H1. Advertising (β = 0.506, t = 9.198, p = 0.000) was found to have a 
significantly positive effect on consumer perception, thus supported H2. Con-
sumer awareness (β = 0.367, t = 18.281, p = 0.000) was found to have a signifi-
cantly positive effect on consumer buying behavior, thus supported H3. Con-
sumer perception (β = 0.370, t = 4.828, p = 0.000) was found to have a signifi-
cantly positive effect on consumer buying behavior, thus supported H4.  

4.4. The Mediation Analysis 

The study’s mediation analysis findings are shown in Table 6. The mediation 
study indicates how much the indirect effect of consumer awareness and con-
sumer perception modified the proposed direct path (advertising and consumer 
buying behavior). As a result, advertising and consumer buying behavior were 
all considered to be correlated with consumer awareness and consumer percep-
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tion in this study. By comparing the directions of the various indirect paths with 
their direct paths and the significance levels, the mediating impact was assessed. 
Zhao et al. (2010) have proven the validity of this mediation analysis method. 
The analysis of the data confirms that consumer awareness mediates the rela-
tionship between advertising and consumer buying behavior (β = 0.198; t = 
3.978; p = 0.000). Thus, consumer perception plays a very important role in the 
relationship between advertising and consumer buying behavior (β = 0.187; t = 
3.890; p = 0.000). Following Bagozzi and Yi (2012), some approximate fit heuris-
tics were also assessed to provide additional information on model fit and the 
indicators ranged from acceptable to excellent. A six-factor confirmatory factor 
analysis model fits the data very well, with indicators meeting the specific crite-
ria observed in Table 7 which shows that chi-square = 595.156, NFI = 0.771, and 
SRMR = 0.144. 
 

 
Figure 2. The positive reading of all the variables.  

 
Table 5. Structural model from the hypothesized relationships. 

 Study’s hypothesis Hypothesis Path Coefficient T Statistics p Values Supported/Rejected 

A -> CA H1 0.539 9.147 0.000 Supported 

A -> CP H2 0.506 9.198 0.000 Supported 

CA -> CBB H3 0.367 4.865 0.000 Supported 

CP -> CBB H4 0.370 4.828 0.000 Supported 

 
Table 6. Indirect effects. 

 Study’s hypothesis Path Coefficient T Statistics p Values Supported/Rejected 

A -> CA -> CBB 0.198 3.978 0.000 Supported 

A -> CP -> CBB 0.187 3.890 0.000 Supported 

Note: A = Advertising; CA = Consumer Awareness; CBB = Consumer Buying Behavior; whereas CP = Consumer Percep-
tion.  
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Table 7. Model fit summary. 

  Saturated Model Estimated Model 

SRMR 0.070 0.144 

d_ULS 1.039 4.333 

d_G 0.434 0.597 

Chi-Square 496.293 595.156 

NFI 0.809 0.771 

4.5. Discussion of the Study  

Buying is a complex process involving a series of decisions and important ques-
tions such as what to buy, where to buy, when to buy and how to buy. This series 
of decisions are driven by consumer awareness and consumer perception. Buy-
ers learn about products through one or more sources and get more information 
about brands and products. In our research, we look at advertising as a funda-
mental source of awareness-building in the minds of customers. The main rea-
son for creating awareness in the minds of customers is the content and infor-
mation used in a particular advertisement. In the same way, the content of ad-
vertisements also establishes the perception of customers who are viewing those 
advertisements. Our findings show that these ads are a major source of creating 
awareness and shaping customer perceptions. Consumer awareness and con-
sumer perception are considered to be the two main drivers that lead to pur-
chasing decisions. 

The regression result shows that, advertising (β = 0.539, t = 9.147, p = 0.000) 
was found to have a significantly positive effect on consumer awareness of in-
surance products. This is in line with Fatima & Lodhi (2015), who considered 
advertising as a way of communicating with the audience. They believe that cul-
ture has a great influence on people’s buying behavior, as each person has dif-
ferent needs and trends based on their lifestyle. Therefore, if we say that adver-
tising is like magic, it would not be wrong because advertising actually changes 
people’s needs and desires, and sometimes it creates people’s needs (Rasool et 
al., 2012). People are highly influenced by advertising, and organizations are 
trying to target the masses. Organizations are using online and offline tech-
niques to advertise the best fit for their products. The researchers found that 
media ads are the most popular ads, people love TV ads, so it is an appropriate 
medium to promote products such as insurance products. 

With regards to advertising the regression results show that, it has a positive 
relationship with consumer perception with (β = 0.506, t = 9.198, p = 0.000). 
This is in accordance with Rai (2013), that there are several national and inter-
national brands that people recognize and have a strong perception in their 
hearts. These concepts are ingrained in their minds due to their culture, lifestyle 
and environment. In addition, advertising also plays a very important role in 
shaping consumer behavior. Advertisements are what motivate them to buy a 
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particular product. Advertising is also a source of trust building. If the consumer 
is looking for the quality and price of the product, he will be greatly induced. 
Buying attitudes can also be built through product evaluation and brand percep-
tion (Rai, 2013). 

Consumer awareness was assessed and the regression result shows that, it has 
a positive impact on consumer buying behavior with (β = 0.367, t = 18.281, p = 
0.000). This result confirms the findings of many previous empirical studies 
(Aertsens et al., 2011; Feldmann & Hamm, 2015; Teng & Wang, 2015), that lack 
of awareness of organic food is considered a barrier to purchasing organic food. 
Some findings further explain that awareness of organic food affects consumer 
trust (Teng & Wang, 2015), utilitarian attitudes (Lee and Yun, 2015), and prod-
uct value (Hung et al., 2013). 

Consumer perception was assessed and the regression results show that it has 
positive impact on consumer buying behavior with (β = 0.370, t = 4.828, p = 
0.000). This result confirms the results of Kubendran and Vanniarajan (2005) 
that consumers’ perception and use of any product may change due to changes 
in dietary habits. If the income and urbanization of consumer’s increase, the 
percentage of income spent on consumption will increase. Compared with rural 
consumers, urban consumers prefer branded products.  

5. Conclusion  

This particular study aimed to find out the impact of advertising on purchase 
behavior of insurance products in Ghana. Research shows that there are four 
important variables that can influence people’s buying behavior. The study was 
conducted on the premise of the Kumasi metropolitan area and targeted 200 
respondents who use various insurance products from different brands in Gha-
na. The results of reviewing these advertisements helped increase consumer 
awareness. TVCs and billboards are widely used by different marketing depart-
ments of insurance companies that target online and above through these me-
diums. Their ads contain enough information to attract consumers and build 
awareness in the minds of customers. The first hypothesis should examine the 
relationship between advertising and consumer awareness. The results show that 
there is a relationship between the two. People gain awareness through adver-
tisements about insurance products in Ghana. Our second hypothesis should 
examine the relationship between perception and advertising. The results sup-
port the hypothesis that suggests a relationship between advertising and con-
sumer perception. This is because advertising can generate perceptions in the 
minds of customers. Primarily driven by perception of product usage, other op-
tions include recommendations from peers, friends, colleagues, etc. It is also 
important that users of insurance products in Ghana are very loyal to their 
brands and they cannot easily transfer to other brands. The findings are similar 
to those of Chaudhry, Awan, & Hussain (2017); Sulaiman & Hadi (2017). After 
analyzing these two variables influenced by advertising, we found the relation-
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ship between these two variables and people’s buying behavior. In this regard, 
we accept a third hypothesis, which aims at whether there is a relationship be-
tween consumer awareness and perception and purchasing behavior. Although 
these two variables have little effect on purchasing behavior, they are still two 
important variables influencing the purchase of insurance products by Ghanaian 
consumers.  

In the end, we concluded that insurers should use engaging and informative 
content to increase consumer awareness, and they should also rely on advertis-
ing to change consumers’ perceptions rather than using new promotions or oth-
er mediums to change people’s perceptions. Any insurer can easily change con-
sumer buying behavior by building awareness and building strong perceptions 
in the minds of customers. 

The findings have practical significance for insurance company managers who 
are curious to understand the motivations behind potential customers who 
might buy their products. The results of this study may also be taken into ac-
count when establishing marketing strategies by foreign businesses that want to 
promote their insurance products in emerging nations. For instance, companies 
that currently offer insurance goods or want to do so in a developing economy 
like Ghana, where individuals have less disposable income, should reconsider 
their pricing strategy. The majority of Ghanaian consumers are concerned with 
price. Therefore, such services should not be presented as a special product and 
shouldn’t be costly just because it’s “insurance” to encourage the general public 
to accept the idea of insurance. Instead of being a mass-market item that can be 
consumed by all, overpricing it will turn the product into a niche item that will 
only be purchased by a specific segment of the population. Marketers in a de-
veloping country must, at least initially, ensure that insurance products are dis-
tributed to the appropriate markets. For instance, in the big cities, where the 
majority of the middle class resides, insurance products are likely to do well in 
the market. 

5.1. Recommendations 

The study suggests that insurers should focus on plans that bring more flavor 
and variety, rather than repeating the same old plans a second time. It’s always 
better to be first. Since insurance advertisements have been shown to have a sig-
nificant beneficial impact on consumers’ intentions to purchase the advertised 
brand, insurance companies must continue to advertise their products in the in-
surance sector. Because they can reach a huge number of target audiences, radio, 
television, and online advertisements are the best types of advertising that 
should be used. Such advertisements need to be created in a way that would 
strategically encompass all the elements of an effective and well-executed adver-
tising plan. Advertisers must integrate advertising strategies targeting clients. 
Product positioning strategy must be at the heart of management to help drive 
sales. Ghanaian consumers are now discerning and don’t just like anything a 
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business advertises. Therefore, businesses must improve their products in terms 
of quality and functionality, rather than relying solely on popular celebrities or 
other deceptive advertisements to influence purchasing decisions. 

5.2. Limitations and Future Research Directions  

There are a number of limitations to this study, in particular the presence of 
many relevant variables that can alter consumer behavior in insurance product 
use in Ghana, which we were unable to cover. Additionally, government bu-
reaucracies limit our access to vast amounts of information during the data col-
lection process. Third, the results may not generalize to other places and con-
texts due to differences in environment, cultural attitudes, and beliefs. Based on 
the findings and conclusions provided, the management of these insurance 
companies should: Pay more attention to outdoor advertising and increase the 
number of billboards, posters, etc. Television and print advertising also play an 
important role. Therefore, insurers should put considerable effort into this, as it 
provides consumers with more explanatory information. Management is advised 
to shift its spending on celebrity ads to another ad because people pay less or no 
attention to celebrity advertisement. 
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