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Abstract 
Purpose: Based on the theory of ego depletion, this paper takes employees as 
the main research object, explores the influence of performance pressure on 
helping behavior, and analyzes the mediating role of workplace anxiety and 
the moderating effect of agreeableness. Design/Methodology/Approach: 216 
employees in Chinese enterprises were investigated in this research, and con-
firmatory factor analysis, hierarchical regression analysis, and bootstrap re-
gression analysis were used to verify the hypotheses. Findings: Performance 
pressure negatively affects employee helping behavior; workplace anxiety plays 
a mediating role in the negative relationship between performance pressure 
and employee helping behavior; agreeableness has a moderating effect on the 
relationship between workplace anxiety and helping behavior. Originali-
ty/Value: The research conclusions enrich the results of performance pres-
sure, and provide a reasonable and novel theoretical perspective for enter-
prises to alleviate the workplace anxiety of employees and promote the im-
plementation of helping behavior in the organization. 
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1. Introduction 

With the continuous progress of the economy and society, the development of 
enterprises is accompanied by higher performance requirements and more chal-
lenging work tasks within the organization. Individual employees in the organi-
zation are also faced with higher performance requirements, and the resulting 
performance pressure has also caused more negative effects. The previous re-
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search found that performance pressure will lead to the generation of individual 
self-destruction, resulting in pro-organizational unethical behavior of employees 
(Li et al., 2018: p. 358). This means that employees with high performance pres-
sure are likely to ignore the ethics in work. How to deal with the situation when 
colleagues seek help under such circumstances? As a kind of pro-social behavior, 
helping behavior is closely related to the ideology and morality of the giver. 
Helping behavior in the organization is very important to the development of 
the organization. It can not only give full play to the skills and expertise of each 
employee, but also enhance the cohesion of the team (Xiao & Zhang, 2020: p. 
27). Moderate helping behavior will have a positive impact on the career growth 
of employees, team efficiency and team vitality (Podsakoff et al., 1997: p. 262). 

So how does performance pressure in the workplace affect helping behavior? 
How can business managers improve employee’s helping behavior from the pers-
pective of performance pressure? According to these questions, this paper in-
troduces workplace anxiety as a mediating effect and agreeableness as a mod-
erating effect to analyze and discuss. When employees find it difficult to achieve 
the performance goals set by the organization, performance pressure will occur, 
followed by workplace anxiety, which will have an impact on employees’ helping 
behavior. However, when individuals face workplace anxiety, their attitude to-
wards helping others will change according to their personality traits. Some stu-
dies show that employees’ prosocial behavior is affected by their personality traits 
(Eisenberg & Miller, 1987: p. 91). Agreeableness reflects the motivation of indi-
viduals to maintain harmonious interpersonal relationships. Compared with low- 
agreeableness individuals, high-agreeableness individuals pay more attention to 
actively maintaining friendly relations and cooperative atmosphere between 
teams (Ehrhart & Naumann, 2004: p. 960), and are more willing to implement 
helping others. From this point of view, it is speculated that agreeableness may 
regulate the relationship between workplace anxiety and helping behavior, and 
then play a role in the process of performance pressure affecting helping beha-
vior. 

To sum up, based on the theory of ego depletion, this paper discusses the process 
of the influence of performance pressure on helping behavior through workplace 
anxiety at the individual level of employees, and takes agreeableness as the regu-
latory effect, with a view to enriching relevant theoretical research and putting 
forward suggestions for organizations and managers to effectively improve their 
helping behavior in practice. 

2. Literature Review and Hypotheses 
2.1. The Theory of Ego Depletion 

Ego depletion refers to the decline of the individual’s ability or willingness to act 
in the process of controlling the environment and themselves (Baumeister et al., 
1998: p. 1252). Ego depletion theory is reflected in the limited psychological 
energy of individuals, which is constantly consumed in the process of controlling 

https://doi.org/10.4236/jhrss.2023.111001


X. T. Chen, Y. Li 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/jhrss.2023.111001 3 Journal of Human Resource and Sustainability Studies 
 

their thoughts, feelings and behaviors to support the realization of self-execution 
function (Muraven & Baumeister, 2000: pp. 247-259). When carrying out activi-
ties that require self-control, excessive use of limited psychological energy will 
lead to ego depletion, which will limit the self-control ability of individuals in the 
face of subsequent behaviors (Rachman, 2012: p. 502). Research shows that the 
inhibitory voice requires the speaker to be highly alert to the problems in the 
work, which causes the speaker’s personal loss and hinders their destructive 
voice behavior (Lin, Ma, & Johnson, 2016: p. 815). It embodies a core principle 
of the theory of ego depletion: the loss caused by the efforts of self-control in the 
early stage will inhibit people’s self-control ability in subsequent tasks (Malhotra, 
Ku, & Murniuhan, 2008: p. 78). 

2.2. Performance Pressure and Helping Behavior 

Performance pressure is a kind of pressure source with short time and rich con-
notation. It has been defined as the gap between the performance prediction re-
sults recognized by the organization and the potential performance of the or-
ganization (Matsumoto, 2002: p. 285). Researcher believes that performance 
pressure is a collection of interrelated factors that can enhance the team to pro-
duce good output (Gardner, 2012: p. 46). Performance pressure is different from 
other external pressures. External pressures include time pressure, crisis pres-
sure, etc., such as completing tasks within the specified time and being forced to 
make adjustments after encountering a crisis. Performance pressure reflects per-
formance (Durhamd & Locke, 2000: p. 115), which indicates some physiological 
and psychological reactions when employees perceive that their abilities and re-
quirements do not match when facing performance tasks. Research shows that 
feeling performance pressure will promote self-regulation exhaustion through 
stress assessment and self-regulation, and then affect employees’ later actions 
(Mitchell et al., 2019: p. 531). This paper speculates that employees’ ego depletion 
caused by performance pressure will cause their own cognitive and emotional 
changes, and further affect employees’ helping behavior. 

The act of helping others was initially defined as the act of providing help to 
others without seeking return. Research shows incorporated helping behavior into 
organizational citizenship behavior and defined helping behavior as voluntary 
helping others predict or solve problems in advance (Podsakoff et al., 2000: p. 
533). With the continuous development of research on organizational citizen-
ship behavior, scholars differentiated organizational citizenship behavior and be-
gan to carry out targeted research on helping behavior, and more carefully in-
vestigated the generation and impact of helping behavior. For example, helping 
behavior is defined as the behavior in that employees spend their time and energy 
to support others’ work tasks for free (Bamberger, 2009: p. 49). It is defined that 
employees in the organization voluntarily provide work information and resources 
for colleagues and share work tasks in other ways. The existing research mainly 
explores the antecedents and effects of responsible leadership, ethical leadership 
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and other leadership behaviors, individual emotion, team atmosphere, personal 
characteristics (Konovsky & Organ, 1996: p. 253), and other behaviors; but at 
present, the impact mechanism of performance pressure on helping behaviors 
has not been studied. 

Because employees facing performance pressure think that high performance 
is necessary, they will stimulate their motivation for achievement and think that 
performance will be linked to their organizational status. In order to complete 
the performance tasks, set by the organization, employees will consume individ-
ual limited energy in the process of completing. At this time, employees mainly 
focus on completing the tasks assigned to them by the organization within the 
specified time. The resulting ego depletion inhibits the individual’s will and energy 
to help others in the later stage. At the same time, the increase of performance 
pressure will lead to the generation of employees’ negative emotions. Employees 
need to allocate some energy to regulate their negative emotions while complet-
ing their work tasks. In the process of dealing with such emotions, it is easy to 
ignore the consideration of moral aspects, thus reducing the generation of em-
ployees’ helping behaviors. 

H1: Performance pressure negatively affects employees’ helping behavior. 

2.3. The Mediating Role of Workplace Anxiety 

Ego depletion theory emphasizes that the loss caused by self-control in the early 
stage will lead to the decline of self-control ability of employees in subsequent 
work tasks. Previous studies have shown that the organization’s high-performance 
requirements for employees have brought performance pressure and anxiety to 
employees. Employees have performance pressure to achieve performance goals, 
while individuals have only limited resources to regulate adverse emotional reac-
tions. In the face of performance pressure, employees have to control their own 
activities, which will lead to the consumption of psychological energy. In the state 
of self-consumption, the self-control ability of follow-up behavior is limited, and 
the negative impact of performance pressure on individuals cannot be com-
pletely consumed, resulting in workplace anxiety and anxiety. If employees have 
sustained negative emotions in the work environment, the lack of individual 
control ability may lead to resource exhaustion and anxiety (Baumeister et al., 
1998: p. 1252). To sum up, the following assumptions are proposed: 

H2: Performance pressure positively affects workplace anxiety. 
Workplace anxiety will affect individual behavior. Research has pointed out 

that the negative emotion of employees will reduce the helping behavior in the 
workplace (Liu et al., 2020: p. 362). After the occurrence of workplace anxiety, 
the psychological and physical resources will be mobilized for self-defense to 
avoid danger. This self-psychological adjustment will further consume personal 
adjustment resources. Since helping behavior is a behavior involving interper-
sonal communication, its social nature determines that the implementer of 
helping behavior needs a lot of energy of self-control. This means that imple-
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menting helping behavior requires more time and energy for effective role beha-
vior and social relationship management, so the generation of workplace anxiety 
is not conducive to the implementation of helping behavior by employees. 

Therefore, this study believes that performance pressure will lead to workplace 
anxiety. In order to alleviate the impact of performance pressure from anxiety, 
individuals will reduce the frequency of helping others at work. To sum up, the 
following assumptions are proposed: 

H3: Workplace anxiety negatively affects helping behavior. 
H4: Workplace anxiety plays an intermediary role between performance pres-

sure and helping behavior. 

2.4. The Moderating Role of Agreeableness 

As a basic personality trait, agreeableness is altruistic, and high-agreeableness 
individuals have higher empathy and forgiveness abilities. At the same time, they 
pay more attention to teamwork and interpersonal harmony, and focus more on 
the interests of others in interpersonal relationships. In the face of complex work 
tasks, individuals who can better deal with individual performance pressure and 
interpersonal relationships in the team (Moberg, 2001: p. 47) are willing to inte-
ract with other people, and usually show pro-social orientation (Martin, Kell, & 
Motowidlo, 2016: p. 41). Therefore, in the face of performance pressure and 
workplace anxiety, employees with high agreeableness are more willing to im-
plement helping behavior. 

Specifically, in the face of performance pressure and workplace anxiety, high- 
agreeableness employees will give priority to the overall interests of themselves 
and team members, and are more willing to provide help to colleagues who in 
difficulties, in order to maintain a good interpersonal relationship, and reduce 
the negative impact of performance pressure and workplace anxiety on team in-
ternal cooperation (Beersma & De Dreu, 2002: p. 227). On the contrary, 
low-agreeableness employees tend to be self-centered (Jesen & Graziano, 2001: 
p. 323), and are more likely to refuse to help others when facing their own per-
formance requirements and anxiety. To sum up, the following assumptions are 
proposed: 

H5: Agreeableness regulates the relationship between workplace anxiety and 
helping behavior. The negative relationship between workplace anxiety and help-
ing behavior is weak for high-agreeableness and is stronger for low-agreeableness 
employees. 

The model to be studied in this paper is shown in Figure 1. 

3. Methodology 

The research samples of this study mainly come from the employees of 10 en-
terprises in Xi’an, Taiyuanand Yangzhou, No. 1 and No. 2 are two financial in-
stitutions in Xi’an, No. 3 to No. 5 are information technology enterprises in 
Xi’an, No. 6 to No. 8 are three educational institutions in Taiyuan, No. 9 is a  
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Figure 1. Research model. 
 
manufacturing enterprise in Yangzhou, and No. 10 is a real estate enterprise in 
Yangzhou. Due to the epidemic situation, data collection is mainly online. We 
first communicated with the managers of the enterprisesto check the reliability 
of the data, explained the research purpose, research sample requirements and 
questionnaire content, and then sent the questionnaire to the participants in the 
form of an electronic link. The purpose of the study and the random reward af-
ter answering the questions are explained again at the beginning of the electronic 
questionnaire to ensure the effectiveness of online data. At the same time, to 
avoid the effect of the deviation of the general method on the measurement re-
sults as far as possible, the questionnaire survey of this study is divided into two 
times: 151 and 140 questionnaires are recovered, respectively. Finally, this study 
is based on 261 valid questionnaires (the effective recovery rate is 89.7%). The 
sample consisted of 57.3% female employees. 49% of the samples were aged be-
tween 20 and 30.Over 85.6%of the sample graduated from university. 39.5% of 
the respondents had working with their immediate superiors for more than 3 
years. 33.1% of the sample had up to 5 years of work experience. Table 1 shows 
the specific demographic information in this survey. 

Performance pressure was used by 7 items (α = 0.970) translated by Yang 
(Yang, 2004: p. 62). Workplace anxiety has used the scale to measure by Mccar-
thy (McCarthy, Trougakos, & Cheng, 2016: p. 279), including 8 items (α = 
0.960). Agreeableness was used by 4 items (α = 0.938) developed by domestic 
scholars Zhu (Zhu, 2012: p. 120). Helping behavior was used by 7 items (α = 
0.954) developed by Podsakoff (Podsakoff, Ahearne, & Mackenzie, 1997: p. 262). 
All of the scales were used a five-point scale from “1” to “5” which meansfrom 
“strongly agree” to “strongly disagree”. 

Control variables Previous studies suggested that gender, age, education level, 
working years and working time with immediate superior. 

4. Data Analysis 
4.1. Discriminant Validity 

The AVE has to be greater than 0.50 (between 0.553 to 0.756), the result verified 
the exploratory factor analysis. To confirm whether factor specification matches 
the actual data, AMOS 23.0 is used to verify confirmatory factor analysis (CFA). 
By comparing one-factor (Performance pressure, workplace anxiety, agreeable-
ness and helping behavior as one factor) with four-factor models (Performance 
pressure, workplace anxiety, agreeableness and helping behavior as four separate  
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Table 1. Demographic information 

Variables Category Frequency Proportion (%) 

Gender 
Male 110 50.9% 

Female 106 49.1% 

Age 

Under 20 years old 5 2.3% 

21 - 30 years old 69 31.9% 

31 - 40 years old 46 21.3% 

41 - 50 years old 48 22.2% 

Over 50 years old 48 22.2% 

Educational 
level 

High school and below 31 14.4% 

Junior college 78 36.1% 

Bachelor 86 39.8% 

Master 21 9.7% 

Position grade 

Basic level 138 63.9% 

Middle level 64 29.6% 

High level 14 6.5% 

Note(s): N = 261. 

 
factors). The results showed that the four-factor model (χ2/df = 1.894, RMSEA = 
0.053. CFI = 0.905. TLI = 0.902. IFI = 0.906) provided allowable models that are 
more consistent with the data than the one-factor model (χ2/df = 5.725, RMSEA 
= 0.063. CFI = 0.710. TLI = 0.700. IFI = 0.711). As a result, the structure of the 
assumption factor was examined. 

4.2. Descriptive Statistics and Correlations 

The data were analyzed by mean value, standard deviation and correlation coef-
ficient between variables, as the results shown in Table 2. It can be seen that 
performance pressure show a positive relationship with workplace anxiety (β = 
0.68, p < 0.01), and a negative relationship with agreeableness (β = −0.15, p < 
0.05) and helping behavior (β = −0.35, p < 0.01), which provisionally support the 
relevant assumptions of this investigation. The results are shown in Table 2. 

4.3. Hypotheses Testing 

In order to test our hypotheses, hierarchical regression analysesare the first me-
thod we used, and the results are shown in Table 3. The control variables were 
put in model 1 and model 3 firstly, and then the independent variable was put in 
model 2 and model 4. According to the data in Table 3, the regression coeffi-
cient of performance pressure on helping behavior is significant (β = −0.34, t = 
5.47, p < 0.01). After adding control variables, performance pressure and helping 
behavior have a significant negative impact. Hypothesis 1 is tested. 
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Table 2. Results of correlation analysis. 

 
M SD 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 

Gender 1.60 0.49 
       

 

Age 3.30 1.20 −0.02 
      

 

Educational level 2.45 0.86 −0.03 −0.38** 1 
    

 

Position grade 1.43 0.61 −0.15* 0.06 0.18** 1 
   

 

Performance pressure 3.44 0.88 0.13 −0.09 0.10 0.04 1 
  

 

Workplace anxiety 3.29 1.00 0.08 −0.10 0.08 0.01 0.68** 1 
 

 

Agreeableness 3.95 0.65 −0.03 0.21** −0.02 −0.03 −0.15* −0.14* 1  

Helping behavior 3.84 0.75 0.05 0.21** 0.05 0.07 −0.35** −0.39** 0.60** 1 

Note(s): N = 261, *p < 0.05, **p < 0.01. 

 
Table 3. Results of intermediary effect. 

Variables 
Workplace anxiety Helping behavior 

M1 M2 M3 M4 M5 M6 

Gender 0.01 −0.02 0.08 0.09 0.08 0.08 

Age −0.07 −0.01 0.26** 0.24 0.23** 0.23 

Educational level 0.05 0.00 0.14 0.17 0.16 0.16 

Position grade 0.00 −0.03 0.04 0.05 0.04 0.04 

Performance pressure 
 

0.87** 
 

−0.34** 
 

−0.06 

Workplace anxiety     −0.38** −0.33** 

R2 0.01 0.75 0.07 0.18 0.21 0.21 

F 0.62 126.21** 3.88** 9.50** 11.25** 9.37** 

Note(s): N = 261, *p < 0.05, **p < 0.01. 
 

The hierarchical regression method in SPSS24.0 was used to verify the inter-
mediary role of workplace anxiety between performance stress and helping be-
havior. The verification of intermediary effect includes the following steps: first, 
determine the impact of performance pressure on helping behavior, which has 
been verified in hypothesis 1; the second is the effect of performance stress on 
workplace anxiety. According to Table 3, Model 1 tests the effect of control va-
riables on workplace anxiety. Model 2 adds performance pressure on the basis of 
Model 1, and the regression coefficient of workplace anxiety is significant (β = 
0.87, t = 24.93, p < 0.01), indicating that performance pressure has a significant 
positive impact on workplace anxiety. Therefore, hypothesis 2 is tested. Adding 
control variables and intermediary variables into model 5, workplace anxiety has 
a significant negative impact on employee helping behavior (β = −0.38, t = 
−6.17, p < 0.01), and hypothesis 3 is tested. Model 6 regressed the control va-
riables, performance pressure and workplace anxiety on helping behavior, and 
found that workplace anxiety had a significant negative impact on helping beha-
vior (β = −0.33, t =− 2.7, p < 0.05). At this time, the effect of performance pres-
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sure on helping behavior changed from −0.30 to −0.06, and the negative impact 
of performance pressure on helping behavior decreased, indicating that workplace 
anxiety has a mediating effect between performance pressure and helping beha-
vior. Therefore, hypothesis 4 is tested. 

From model 3 in Table 4, we can see that the interaction between workplace 
anxiety and agreeableness has a significant positive impact on helping behavior 
(β = 0.14, p < 0.05), this shows that the higher agreeableness, the weaker the 
negative impact of workplace anxiety on helping behavior. Hypothesis 5 is tested. 

The Bootstrap in PROCESS was used to carry out 5000 return sampling. The 
results show the low agreeableness is −1 standard deviation, and the highly 
agreeableness is +1 standard deviation. When the agreeableness is high, the rela-
tionship between workplace anxiety and helping behavior is weak (b = −0.19,95% 
unbiased confidence interval is [−0.3476, −0.0503], excluding 0; When appro-
priate agreeableness is low, workplace anxiety has a significant relationship with 
helping behavior (b = −0.30, 95% unbiased confidence interval is [−0.4978, 
−0.1563], excluding 0, indicating that appropriate agreeableness positively regu-
lates the negative relationship between workplace anxiety and helping behavior. 
When agreeableness is high, the negative relationship decreases, and when 
agreeableness is low, the negative relationship increases. Hypothesis 5 is further 
tested. 

5. Discussion and Implications 

Based on previous empirical findings, performance pressure can reduce the help-
fulness of employees, and indirectly affect the employees’ helping behavior by 
influencing workplace anxiety. In general, this paper enriches the research on per-
formance pressure and helping behavior. According to the above data results, 
the specific discussion is as follows: 

Performance pressure has a negative impact on employee helping behavior.  
 

Table 4. Results of moderating effect. 

Variables 
Helping behavior 

M1 M2 M3 

Gender 0.06 0.11 0.12 

Age 0.26 0.10 0.10 

Educational level 0.14 0.11 0.10 

Position grade 0.04 0.08 0.09 

Workplace anxiety 
 

−0.31** −0.33** 

Agreeableness 
 

0.57** 0.58** 

Workplace anxiety * Agreeableness 
  

0.14* 

R2 0.07 0.52 0.53 

F 3.78** 37.63** 33.21** 

Note(s): N = 261, *p < 0.05, **p < 0.01. 
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When employees feel the pressure of performance and start to self-regulate, they 
will consume resources and cause self-loss. Resource exhaustion has an impact 
on the individual’s self-regulation ability, which makes the individual lack the 
necessary resources to implement the helping behavior. Previous studies have 
also confirmed that performance pressure can lead to individual negative beha-
vior, but no research has focused on the impact of performance pressure on em-
ployee helping behavior. Based on previous studies, this study enriches the study 
of the “negative side” of the impact of performance pressure. 

Workplace anxiety plays an intermediary role between performance pressure 
and helping behavior. Part of the impact of performance pressure on employees’ 
helping behavior is realized by influencing workplace anxiety. According to the 
theory of ego depletion, when employees perceive performance pressure, they 
need to consume individual psychological and physiological resources for ad-
justment. When the individual’s ability to adjust is damaged, anxiety will occur. 
Anxious individuals will reduce the implementation of helping others under the 
condition of ego depletion. 

Agreeableness positively regulates the relationship between workplace anxiety 
and helping behavior, as well as the indirect relationship between performance 
pressure and helping behavior through workplace anxiety. The conclusion of 
this paper shows that agreeableness will affect employees’ self-destruction status 
and alleviate the negative impact of employees’ workplace anxiety on helping 
others. 

5.1. Theoretical Implications 

It explores the relationship and influence mechanism between performance pres-
sure and helping behavior, and enriches the research on the results of perfor-
mance pressure. This paper focuses on performance pressure and its impact on 
helping behavior. From the perspective of research status, the current research on 
performance pressure is relatively rich, including workplace cheating, pro-orga- 
nizational unethical behavior, and the impact on employee engagement. These 
studies have pointed out that performance pressure can cause employees to make 
negative behavior in the workplace, but there is no empirical test on the rela-
tionship between performance pressure and helping behavior. This study not 
only describes the impact of performance pressure on employees’ negative emo-
tions (workplace anxiety) in the workplace, but also reveals its impact on helping 
behavior, enriching the research on performance pressure. 

The research is based on the theory of ego depletion, and explains the em-
ployee’s helping behavior from a new theoretical perspective. In the past, the 
generation mechanism of helping behavior mostly focused on social exchange 
theory and role theory. Based on the theory of ego depletion, starting from the 
ego depletion caused by the limitation of individual resources, this paper intro-
duces workplace anxiety as the intermediary effect and pleasant as the regulatory 
effect, and explains the mechanism of performance pressure on employee help-
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ing behavior. 

5.2. Practical Implications 

Formulate reasonable performance objectives for employees and appropriately 
reduce their performance pressure. According to the research results, employee 
performance pressure will negatively affect employees’ helping behavior, so lead-
ers should arrange reasonable and challenging performance goals for employees 
according to their individual work ability to reduce the possibility of employees’ 
performance pressure. Not only that, managers can help employees better achieve 
their performance goals by providing resources, and can hold regular meetings 
to discuss, exchange experience, and share problem-solving methods; at the same 
time, grass-roots managers should always pay attention to the work progress of 
employees, and intervene to help them solve problems, which will improve the 
possibility of employees’ helping others. 

Pay attention to whether employees have workplace anxiety, and timely help 
them with psychological relief. The results show that performance pressure cause 
anxiety easily, resulting in the inability of employees to implement helping be-
havior, which will have a negative impact on the working atmosphere and team 
cooperation of enterprises. At the same time, for individual employees, long-term 
anxiety may cause immeasurable harm to their physical and mental health. There-
fore, the organization should pay attention to the workplace anxiety of employees 
and conduct effective psychological counseling through various forms; at the 
same time, the organization can also provide appropriate training for employees 
to improve their work ability and help them to achieve performance objectives 
efficiently; provide places for employees to relieve anxiety, such as psychological 
counseling room, catharsis room, etc. Thus, alleviating the impact of workplace 
anxiety on employees’ negative behaviors will not only improve their ability to 
withstand pressure, but also have a positive effect on employees’ helping beha-
viors in the organization. 

5.3. Limitations and Suggestions for Future Research 

The purpose of this paper is to explore the effect of performance pressure on 
employee helping behavior. Influenced by the researcher’s personal ability and 
level, there are many deficiencies in the research process. 

The theoretical model needs to be optimized, and the discussion of the impact 
mechanism is insufficient. Future research can discuss new impact factors. This 
study does not add comfortableness to the model, and the personality traits of 
employees will also affect the helping behavior of employees when they face per-
formance pressure to a certain extent, which can be used as a moderator for fu-
ture research.  

This paper uses workplace anxiety as an intermediary variable. There may be 
other intermediary variables between performance pressure and employee help-
ing behavior. In the future, we can find new intermediary variables from other 
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perspectives to enrich the study of performance pressure. In addition, we can 
also discuss the employee’s helping behavior at the individual and organizational 
levels. The individual’s behavior will be affected by the organizational social sit-
uation, work task characteristics, and so on. In future research, we can start with 
the interaction between the organizational situation and individual characteris-
tics, and carry out more in-depth research. 

The sample source is limited. The data obtained from this questionnaire are 
mainly from Shaanxi, Shanxi and other provinces, and the research samples are 
relatively concentrated. In the future, the sample base can be expanded to make 
it more representative of the population distribution. 

Horizontal data has certain limitations on the causal relationship between re-
search variables, and longitudinal research can be carried out in the future to 
make the results more convincing. Because performance pressure is persistent, 
the perceived performance pressure of individuals will cause emotional, psycho-
logical and physical loss, and if it lasts too long, it may cause psychological and 
physical discomfort. Since this impact is a long-term process, more accurate me-
thods can be used for longitudinal research in the future. 
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