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Abstract 
This research work examined the effect of reward equity on the inclination 
for creative contributions by the innovative employees, with emphasis on the 
equitability of reward systems within an organization. The research also sought 
to investigate the reward processes within ActionAid Nigeria, the factors that 
motivate innovative employee to contribute effectively to organizational ob-
jectives, the role of work structure, leadership behaviour, organizational cul-
ture and corporate strategy in encouraging creativity and innovation of em-
ployees. The research thus seeks to find a solution to the innovation fatigue 
within the organization and to seek recommendations on reward strategy that 
will be equitable and encourage creativity and innovation. 
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1. Introduction 

This research objective seeks to understand the effect of reward equity in en-
couraging creativity and innovation within an organization; understand the mo-
tivating factors for individual employees that will result in creative contribution 
to organizational success while also suggesting ways an organization can im-
prove the reward system in a fair and equitable manner.  

Organizations invest a lot of financial resources in reward management sys-
tems and practices such as basic pay, benefits, and other non-financial rewards 
to create a value proposition that will attract, motivate, and retain the talents for 
organizational success and create a competitive advantage (Antoni et al., 2015).  

The need to balance the three dimensions to organisation’s reward strategy in 
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relation to employer, employee and cost is highly important for business perfor-
mance. While the employer has interest in rewards translating to knowledge, com-
petence and behavior, emphasis is also placed on the affordability and sustaina-
bility of the reward system. The employee on the other hand wants a captivating 
reward that creates a value proposition that will be motivating enough for inno-
vation and retention (Pilbeam & Corbridge, 2010: p. 258). 

Several literature reviews revealed that rewards either financial or non-financial 
can lead to improved employee performance which ultimately translates to or-
ganizational performance. 

The use of reward has been described as a means of controlling, managing, 
and enhancing performance of employees in an organization and the fairness of 
such rewards influences the attitudes and behaviours of employees with respect 
to their contributions to organizational performance (Chen, 2015). The compet-
itive advantage of any firm or organization is its human resources and know-
ledge has also been said to be the most valuable contribution to competitive ad-
vantage (Shenkar & Luo, 2008: p. 42). Knowledge can and has been transferred 
from one organization to another through employee movement. The more an 
organization can create a value proposition through its reward strategy, the more 
it would be able to retain the knowledge for competitive advantage.  

Organizational reward systems that are adequate and competitive are seen as 
one of the most effective instruments for knowledge sharing and teams’ integra-
tion to enhance organizational performance (Chen, 2015: p. 37). It was observed 
that employees’ contributions within organizations are strictly based on their job 
descriptions and little innovation coming up for competitive advantage; also, 
most organizations in the development sector in Nigeria do not have adequate 
reward system in place to create a value proposition for employees and encour-
age innovative ideas, thus there is a lot of movement within and across these or-
ganizations as employees are looking for adequate compensation within the sec-
tor.  

Skalen et al. (2015) defined value proposition as a clear, simple statement of 
the benefits, both tangible and intangible, that the company will provide, along 
with the approximate price it will charge the customer. Skalen et al. (2015) cate-
gorized the value propositions into provision practices, representational practic-
es and management and organizational practices. The provision practice ensures 
that resources are provided to resolve any customer issues to reflect the stated 
value proposition. The representational practices seek to communicate the value 
proposition both internally and externally while the third category management 
and organizational practices provide the working methods and resources re-
quired to hire and retain employees. 

The value proposition created by organizations both internally and externally 
has a direct influence on the attraction and retention of innovative employees to 
an organization for the purposes of creating a competitive advantage for firms. 
The management and organizational practices harmonize both the provisional 
and representational practices by ensuring there is a fulfilment of the proposed 
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value that has been communicated both internally and externally. Management 
and organizational practices clarify the firm’s method of fulfilling the proposed 
value that has been communicated, values such as organizing, staffing and team 
building activities, networking and knowledge sharing that can further enhance 
staff motivation for innovation and retention of organizational knowledge. Ska-
len et al. (2015) in their research discovered that to upgrade employee’s compe-
tency that will enhance innovation and organizational performance, they needed 
to ask key questions on their processes such as what needs to change, what is 
available and what needs to be done to create the change desired. 

One of the most important factors to consider in improving organizational 
performance is motivating employees for better performance. Highly motivated 
employees will be enthusiastic to come to work and creatively perform their du-
ties in a satisfying manner with the expectation that their performance will lead 
to higher remuneration as compensation for their contributions. However, em-
ployees that are not motivated will be lethargic in carrying out their duties and 
will rarely bring innovative ideas that will contribute to better organizational 
performance and ultimately the firm’s competitive advantage (Faletar et al., 
2016). 

The research was based on the observation of the reduced level of innovative 
ideas that would have enhanced the organization’s performance within the sec-
tor it operates. It was also observed that the level of staff attrition was increasing 
due to inequity in the reward system which led to skills set being lost to similar 
organizations within the development sector thereby affecting the research abil-
ity of the organization in implementing projects and programmes. 

The research seeks to investigate the connection between employee motiva-
tion and creativity which influences organizational performance for competitive 
advantage and make recommendations to management of the organization for 
improved reward strategy and processes.  

2. Literature Review 

The literature review examines the theoretical frameworks on previous studies as 
regards the effect of reward equity on the inclination for creative contributions 
of employees. This is guided by two theoretical frameworks, the expectancy 
theory, and the equity theory. The Expectancy theory is one of the leading theo-
ries of motivation proposed earlier in the 19th century which emphasizes the 
need to rationalize work and economic benefits associated with it. The expec-
tancy theory supports the design and management of contingent pay schemes 
and their effectiveness, however there are various factors influencing the expec-
tations of employees that will motivate them to perform effectively (Armstrong, 
2010). Expectancy theory looks at the relationship between organizational re-
wards, personal goals of the employees and the work outcomes—it examines the 
extent an organizational reward meets the employee’s personal goals and the ex-
tent to which the reward attracts the employee to be creative (Ferris, 1977: p. 
606). 
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Armstrong (2010) cites Vroom and Porter and Lawler’s theory, which states 
that employees will be innovative when they are confident that a reward will fol-
low their work and that the reward will be substantial. However, this theory is 
currently being tested by increased global competition and shifting consumer 
demands in the marketplace, making it challenging for businesses to motivate 
their staff (Benson, 2015). 

The second theoretical framework is Equity theory which posits that people 
will perform better and be motivated to work if they are treated in an equitable 
way (Armstrong, 2010: p. 139). However, it has been stated that equity does not 
just relate to individual employees’ motivation but that it is also about the fair-
ness of processes in the entire organization (Armstrong, 2010: p. 142).  

The theory also explains the perception of equitability and in-equitability, 
where the employee observes inequality, the employee can reduce their produc-
tivity or the quality of the job outcome (Al-Zawahreh & Al-Madi, 2012: p. 158). 
The equity theory is perceived to be based on realistic ideas as it is process dri-
ven and examines the motivation of individual employees in an organization as 
well as the impartiality in the reward system of an organization. The two theo-
ries will examine the relevance in today’s organization as well as the relationship 
between the reward processes and what motivates individual employees to put in 
more effort to be the innovative employee in ActionAid Nigeria. 

Innovation has been described as the holy grail for organizations and for or-
ganizations to ensure competitive advantage and growth, there must be new busi-
nesses, services, and products. Innovation activities within organizations are usually 
concentrated within a committed team which means team leadership is quite 
crucial in managing the idea development which is very important to the success 
of any innovation (Alexander & Van Knippenberg, 2014). Employees’ managing 
themselves within a democratic workplace is no longer the norm, however, or-
ganizations are now becoming agile to adapt to the dynamic work environment. 
This is creating a shift from managing to leading, which means leadership must 
be transformational and intellectually stimulating and consider each employee as 
an individual (Benson, 2015). Although this theory was postulated almost two 
decades ago, but it is still relevant in today’s organization as there are challenges 
providing intellectually stimulating environment that will motivate employees to 
be innovative.  

Skalen et al. (2015) in their research discovered that to upgrade employee’s 
competency that will enhance innovation and organizational performance, they 
needed to ask key questions on their processes such as what needs to change, 
what is available and what needs to be done to create the change desired. Man-
agement will need to clarify values such as organizing, staffing and team build-
ing activities, networking and knowledge sharing that can further enhance staff 
motivation for innovation and retention of organizational knowledge. 

Shiva et al. (2011) supported the transfer of knowledge from individuals to 
organizational level as an important process for organization’s competitive ad-
vantage. The need to fully optimize the knowledge that employees possess through 
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knowledge sharing at informal interactions within and across teams promotes 
effective knowledge management and position the organization for competitive 
advantage. 

The global technological advancement and growing need of the organization 
to be agile in catching up with the technology is placing emphasis on the need for 
more knowledge workers within organizations for competitive advantage. One 
of the strategies being adopted by organizations in today’s world is that of total 
rewards, which combines various pay elements that motivate employees for crea-
tivity and innovation (Akhtar et al., 2015). Research has pointed out that em-
ployees are motivated differently; while some prefer financial rewards other ex-
perienced workers are motivated through non-financial rewards such as work-life 
balance, challenging work, recognition and involvement in special projects (Akh-
tar et al., 2015), however other non-financial rewards such as leadership com-
munication styles, trust in professional capability of employees in innovative 
ideas and ownership of intellectual property have not been considered in various 
researches as part of motivating factors for creativity of employees.  

Consequently, organizations must develop robust compensation packages that 
will consider these rewards which will attract and retain competent employees 
for innovative ideas that will translate to competitive advantage for the organiza-
tion. Theory supports that organization has in-house reward system that is tai-
lored to motivate employees to contribute to the achievement of organizational 
goals and objectives. This suggests that organizations should explore different 
incentives that will motivate employees for creative contributions before estab-
lishing their reward systems and such systems should be subjected to periodic 
reviews in line with global best practice and trends within the organization. 
Chen (2015) described reward systems as process based and outcome based. The 
process-based reward system is tied to certain aspect of the procedures, beha-
viours, and accomplishment of certain stages of the product or service develop-
ment process irrespective of the output of that process, while the outcome-based 
reward is tied to the overall result of the process. 

Emphasis on subsequent research on this topic can focus on non-financial 
reward strategies that can motivate employees for creative contribution to orga-
nizational objectives while also looking out for the equitability of such rewards. 
Other areas of further research can investigate what will motivate and retain 
creative employees beyond the financial rewards and benefits provided by the 
organization. Further investigation can also be conducted on the role of leader-
ship behaviour especially leadership communication style in creativity and in-
novation of employees. Also, the role of organizational culture in the innovation 
and creativity of employees can be further investigated. 

3. Methodology  

The chosen methodology for the research was centered around the epistemolog-
ical approach of social constructionist. This approach is termed interpretive as it 
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describes the feelings and thinking of people in relationships (Easterby-Smith et 
al., 2012: pp. 22-24). The ethnography methodology was engaged in this research 
to understand the significance of innovation in relation to motivation of em-
ployees within ActionAid Nigeria.  

The participants are staff of ActionAid Nigeria categorised into junior grade 
level, middle management level and senior management level. The participants 
were chosen based on the researcher’s observation of how employees’ contribu-
tions were strictly based on their job descriptions and little innovation coming 
up for competitive advantage. The survey questionnaire was sent to all the staff 
of the organization to have a wide range of data collection. The qualitative me-
thod of data collection is employed for this research based on the social con-
structionist view which emphasizes the observation of people relationship within 
the work environment, the various meanings that employees give to their work 
experiences and the belief that reality is determined by people rather than the 
external factors (Easterby-Smith et al., 2012: pp. 23-24).  

There are two opinions in epistemological perspective which are described as 
the positivism and social constructionism—these opinions can also be referred 
to as a set of principles that guides a researcher’s choice of methods. The positiv-
ist believes that reality is external and objective and knowledge is of significance 
if it is based on observations of external reality. The social constructionism is 
described as an interpretive method which describes the feelings and thinking of 
people as they relate to each other (Easterby-Smith et al., 2012: pp. 22-24). The 
qualitative method of data collection was used with emphasis on observation of 
people relationship within work environment, the meanings that people give to 
their experiences and the belief that reality is determined by people rather than 
the external factors (Easterby-Smith et al., 2012: pp. 23-24).  

In analyzing the data for the research, a grounded analysis was used as it offers 
a more holistic approach to the analysis and any observation made during data 
collection can be contextualized. Grounded analysis helps to tease out themes, 
patterns and categories that will be declared in the findings and allows for in-
stinctive guidance of the understanding of the data collected (Easterby-Smith et 
al., 2012: pp. 126, 163, 166). This method of analysis was chosen because of the 
researcher’s closeness to the data and the observation made that led to the choice 
of topic and the interview site. 

4. Results and Analysis 

In analyzing the data for the research, a grounded analysis was used as it offers a 
more holistic approach to the analysis and any observation made during data 
collection can be contextualized. Grounded analysis helps to tease out themes, 
patterns and categories that will be declared in the findings (Easterby-Smith et 
al., 2012: p. 166). 

The questionnaire tool deployed was sent to 79 participants drawn from three 
categories of staff—junior, middle level staff and management staff. The gender 
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of the participants was one of the parameters considered in designing the ques-
tionnaire as the organization places emphasis on maintaining gender balance with 
affirmation towards female employees. Length of service of the employees was 
also a consideration to determine when the innovation fatigue sets in. 

The demographics of the respondents regarding gender, grade level and length 
of service of the respondents are as presented in Figures 1-3 below. 

4.1. Gender 

Participants were asked about their gender, 59.26% of the respondents were fe-
male and 40.74% were Male. These are presented in Figure 1 below. 

 

 
Figure 1. Analysis of gender.  

 

 
Figure 2. Analysis of grade level.  

 

 
Figure 3. Analysis of length of service. 
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4.2. Grade Level 

The respondents were asked about their grade level within the organization, 
25.93% were in the junior grade level, 48.15% belong to the middle management 
level, while 25.93% belong to the Management level cadre (Figure 2). 

4.3. Length of Service in the Organization 

Respondents were asked the length of time they had been working in the orga-
nisation to enable the researcher to capture the understanding of these categories 
of staff in terms of the policies around motivation and creative contributions. 
The length of service was categorised into 3; 1 - 3 years, 4 - 6 years and above 7 
years. 38.46% of the respondents have spent 1 - 3 years in the organization, 
23.08% have spent between 4 - 6 years in the organization; while those who have 
spent 7 years and above in the organisation represented 38.46% of the total res-
pondents (Figure 3). 

The research seeks to draw the link between reward and innovation that will 
lead to improved organizational performance by examining the following fac-
tors: 
• Motivation and innovation. 
• Motivation and retention of creative employees. 
• Role of work structure, leadership behaviour, Culture and corporate strategy 

in innovation and creativity of employees. 

4.4. Response to Motivation 

Respondents were asked on how to motivate and retain creative employees within 
the organisation. Almost all respondents agreed that acknowledging employee’s 
contribution will motivate and retain creative employees for improved organisa-
tional performance. Other suggestions are categorised as follows. 

4.5. Improved Remuneration 

30% of the respondents clarified that better pay that will be competitive in the 
sector in which the organization operates will further retain creative employees. 
Linked to the remuneration is the suggestion that the leadership of the organiza-
tion should source for more funding that will increase the number of projects 
being implemented, which will enable the organization to give economic re-
wards to the employees aside the other non-financial rewards and benefits and 
improve the retention of employees.  

4.6. Creating Space for Contributions on Motivations 

20% of respondents recommended creating areas where staff could make com-
ments about what would inspire and keep creative employees on board. One of 
the responses suggested “management of young employees with defined delive-
rables but not tying them down to precise routines” be flexible. 
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4.7. Policies and Processes Review 

40% of respondents suggest “a review of policies and processes such as training 
policy to enable the process to be more rewarding for staff”. The respondents be-
lieve that employee commitment and engagement will improve if there is a clear 
career path within the organisation and linked to their capacity development. 
These, they believe will motivate and retain creative employees. 

4.8. Investment of Trust in Employees 

Leaders need to have trust in their staff and be able to take ownership of intel-
lectual property. This might motivate and retain creative employees if they are 
able to lay claim to some of the organisation’s intellectual property as part of 
their contribution to the literatures produced. 

4.9. Grievance Management 

One of the respondents advised that “Management should not ignore any ru-
mour or grapevine, but that grievance issues should be addressed as they arise”. 
The respondent stated that inadequate management of grievance issues can 
de-motivate staff and cause their exit from the organisation. 

Related findings to existing literature: 
Considering the literature study in chapter two, the respondents’ claim that 

leadership does not place much stock in workers’ professional competence may 
be explained by the organization’s weariness with new ideas. According to 
Mattsson et al. (2016), innovation weariness develops when employees’ expecta-
tions that their efforts would result in high performance are not satisfied. This is 
typically seen as a pattern of declining engagement among employees who have 
worked for the company for between 2 and 10 years. According to the study, 
employees who have been with a company for four to ten years start to exhibit 
signs of irritation when their innovative ideas are not implemented, and they 
frequently attribute this displeasure to the leadership of the company. 

According to the literature analysis, Paul (2015) found that lack of career de-
velopment decreased employee loyalty and engagement, which resulted in the 
employees leaving the company. Without a career development or training poli-
cy in place, organizations face the risk of losing creative staff. The study’s find-
ings showed that lack of career advancement contributed to a loss of job com-
mitment and engagement for 51% of the surveyed employees. This might also be 
related to the organization’s rising attrition rate. 

4.10. Response to Role of Culture and Leadership 

Respondents were questioned about the roles that organizational culture, lea-
dership style, work structure, and company strategy play in employee innovation 
and creativity. In relation to research question 4, Table 1 summarizes the an-
swers to questions 5, 6, and 7. 

In accordance with Table 1, 41% of respondents agreed that the business 

https://doi.org/10.4236/jhrss.2022.104046


F. Oyefusi 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/jhrss.2022.104046 790 Journal of Human Resource and Sustainability Studies 
 

strategy and leadership style support employee innovation and creativity within 
the organization. The respondents also stated that although corporate policy 
supports and encourages innovation in terms of “employee access to personal 
development funds”, there are never enough funds to truly assist and invest in 
innovation and creativity. Additionally, even when donors claim to be interested 
in creativity and innovation, they do not score these attributes, making it risky to 
include in the submission of proposals. 

Although 63% of respondents (Agree and Strongly agree) felt that the organi-
zation’s culture fosters creativity and innovation, only 1.2% of the respondent 
noted that “few staff genuinely produce and seek innovation. Even fewer people 
are prepared to let go of the past and embrace the future. Regarding organiza-
tional structure, 64% of respondents believed that it fosters employee innova-
tion, while 36% disagreed, stating that it does so “within the confines of the mis-
sion, the strategy, the donor, and the revenue levels”. Yes, the format enables 
you to develop novel ideas and propose them for additional examination, ac-
cording to another feedback (Figures 4-6). 

 

 
Figure 4. Leadership behaviour and corporate strategy in relation to innovation 
and creativity.  

 

 
Figure 5. Analysis of organisational culture and innovation. 
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Figure 6. Analysis of organisation’s work structure and creativity.  

 
Table 1. The leadership behaviour, corporate strategy, culture, and work structure en-
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The non-financial reward as mentioned by some respondents are challenging 
work, trainings, work life balance, investment of trust in professional compe-
tency and skills of employees and other social forms of engagement such as re-
treats, and evening outings involving other members of their families.  

5.1. Leadership and Recognition of Employees 

Almost all the respondents agreed that the leadership of the organisation com-
municates ideas and opens them up for debate and contribution by the em-
ployees especially as it relates to staff welfare. They mentioned that it makes the 
employees’ creative knowing that their voices count as regards the strategic di-
rections and decisions of the organisation. The respondents agreed that recogni-
tion of employees’ contribution to organisational performance will motivate 
them for creativity.  

Respondents agreed that the work structure is not limiting but simple enough 
and the systems are well understood by employees, these they felt are effective 
enough to motivate creativity. They further mentioned that the simple structure 
creates flexibility in work deliverables and makes employees control over their 
own area of work which encourages creativity.  

5.2. Investment of Trust 

Most of the respondents in the middle level and management category believed 
leadership needs to invest heavily in trusting employees’ professional compe-
tency, skills, and intellectual capability of employees. This they mentioned will 
allow creative employees to come up with innovative ideas and be able to take 
responsibility for their area of expertise. 

5.3. Ownership of Intellectual Products 

Management should encourage references to employees’ contribution to the 
publications and literatures produced in the course of work to motivate em-
ployees for creativity and confidence in their professional competence. 

5.4. Management of Grievance Issues/Sanctions 

Although there are adequate grievance processes in place, however leadership 
needs to address misconducts immediately and ensure there is equity in sanc-
tions especially for non-performers. The leadership needs to address these issues 
of grievance and sanctions in a prompt manner to encourage creativity and mo-
tivate performing and creative employees for retention. 

5.5. Retention of Youthful Creative Employees 

Managing organizational diversity recognised that employees are unique and 
bring different values to the organization. Though there are challenges in man-
aging organizational diversity, the benefits include adaptability, availability of 
alternatives to problem-solving and array of skills and experiences (Inegbedion 
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et al., 2020). Respondents mentioned that to retain youthful creative employees, 
there is the need for leadership flexibility in managing such employees with clear 
deliverables as these young employees might find it difficult to work in a routine 
manner which means leadership must be able to manage diverse generations in 
the workplace for creativity and innovation. 

6. Conclusion 

The findings of the research suggested that intrinsic reward is very important in 
motivating employees for productivity. The organisation has been able to moti-
vate the employees with financial benefits, however, those benefits need to be re-
viewed and improved upon for competitive advantage of the organisation and 
retention of creative employees. The concept of variable pay, or reward system 
should be adopted by the organisation to increase the innovative performance of 
the employees. The observed feeling of dissonance by the creative employees was 
because of the inequitable system of compensation which led to innovation fati-
gue. Management’s acknowledgment of employee’s contribution to organisa-
tional literature, research and project reports will encourage innovative ideas 
and creativity. This corroborated the findings on employee’s contribution to in-
novative activities because of personal interest (Pellizzoni et al., 2015).  

The above findings confirmed the high attrition rate in the organisation and 
the movement of talented employees to other organisations within the INGO 
sector because of the attractive and equitable reward benefits being offered by 
these organisations. It is therefore imperative that the reward strategies of Ac-
tionAid be reviewed to ensure it is fair, equitable and competitive enough to at-
tract, motivate and retain these talents for innovative contribution and creativity 
of employees.  
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