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Abstract 

Studies have revealed that the prevalence of tobacco abuse in Kenya has con-
tinued to rise sharply over the past few years hence causing worries among 
health providers and agencies mandated to deal with drug abuse. Various re-
ports and surveys by international and local agencies have conducted re-
searches that underscore this observation. The economic burden associated 
with ailments from tobacco abuse in Kenya is enormous. This review explores 
the scope of tobacco abuse in Kenya; loss of livelihoods as well as the health 
implications and disease burden. Published articles were identified using 
electronic searches such as Google scholar, government reports, case studies 
and Web of Science. Most of the eligible articles were those published be-
tween January 2000 and October 2018. The considered studies were evaluated 
against the norms drawn from the Cochrane Reviewers’ Handbook version 
5.0.0. The existing facts on tobacco use by gender in Kenya show that 15.1% 
of the current tobacco users were men while women constituted 0.8%. It is 
estimated that the Kenyan government spends an outrageous 15 bn Kenyan 
shillings (KES) in mopping up the effects of tobacco abuse annually. The 
common smoking cessation approaches mainly employed are communi-
ty-based interventions and media campaigns with very minimal use of medi-
cal interventions. Kenya has tried to control tobacco abuse through legisla-
tion such as the formulation of the 2007 Tobacco control act (TCA). Know-
ledge on tobacco has been enhanced through research, tobacco promotion 
and sponsorship (TAPS), international tobacco control (ITC), Kenya demo-
graphic health survey (KDHS) and Global adult tobacco survey (GATS). De-
spite these efforts, statistics show a worrying trend in tobacco use among the 
young Kenyan population with several studies confirming increase in tobacco 
use among this category of the Kenyan population. Consequently, expendi-
ture arising from tobacco abuse has sharply increased both nationally and at 
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1. Introduction 

Close to 8 billion cigarette sticks are consumed in Kenya annually according to a 
statistical report by the World Health Organization (WHO) [1]. Currently, Kenya’s 
population is estimated at 50 million implying that cigarette smoking in Kenya 
may have increased to about 10 billion sticks annually. This translates to a finan-
cial burden of approximately 40 billion Kenya shillings (KES)—money that would 
have otherwise been used in providing essential services to Kenyans thereby im-
proving their standards of living. This unfortunate expenditure on cigarette smok-
ing and tobacco abuse is a precursor for disease and poverty among the Kenyan 
communities [2]. The 2014 Global adult tobacco survey reported the prevalence 
of tobacco consumption in Kenya as 19.1% for males and 4.5% for females [3]. 
On the other hand, Lore’s survey on health care workers in Kenya reported a 
“current smoking” prevalence of 54%, with males predominating (63.9% of all 
subjects sampled) [4]. Kwamanga and others (2003) found a prevalence rate 
among primary school teachers of 50% in males and 3% in females (n = 813) [5] 
[6]. Statistics from the Global Youth Tobacco Survey conducted in 2007 revealed 
that 18.5% of the youth aged between 13 and 15 used tobacco products [7].  

A study that was conducted in 2008 revealed 19% of males and 2% of females 
smoke tobacco [8]. Central province showed tobacco prevalence of 30.4%, East-
ern Kenya 26%, Coastal region 22.6%, Nairobi city 17.1%, North Eastern region 
15.6%, the larger Rift valley 14.3%, Western Kenya 11.2% whereas prevalence of 
cigarette smoking in the larger Nyanza region was reported to be the lowest at 
7.9% [9]. Menthol and sweet menthol cigarettes were reported to be popular 
with males in Kenya compared to male cigarette smokers in other international 
tobacco control (ITC) approved countries [10]. The use of flavoring in cigarettes 
is a threat to tobacco control measures because it is reported that flooring pro-
vides a smooth sensation to the respiratory system thus leading to heavy smok-
ing [10]. Most female smokers, for fear of stigmatization do not reveal their 
smoking status. This made the findings from this study biased towards the male 
counterparts [11]. Another study by the Kenya Global Youth Tobacco Survey 
that was done in 2001 reported that among school going children, 13% of these 
children aged between 12 - 15 years used tobacco products. 7.2% constituted 
those that smoke tobacco while 8.5% were found to use other forms of tobacco 
such as sniffing [12]. Another survey targeting students was done in 2007. The 
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findings indicated that 18.2% of boys and 18.2% of girls constituting an overal 
18.6% of the students abused any tobacco product. The current standing of to-
bacco smokers was at 9.8% while 12.8% were found to use other forms of tobac-
co such as sniffing [12]. The findings of the study also revealed a 43% increase in 
tobacco use among children [4]. The Increase in boys was reported to stand at 
15.2% compared to that of girls which was noted to be 82% increase in a period 
of six years. Smoking prevalence among the school going children over the same 
period was revealed to stand at 77.8% [4]. The passing of the Tobacco Control 
Act (TCA) of 2007 and the ratification of FCTR (2004) by WHO has made 
Kenya to make major strides in tobacco control [13]. TCA was passed by the 
Kenyan parliament and governs tobacco control abuse in Kenya. Its main objec-
tive was to support research and dissemination of information to the general 
public. Through tobacco control action plan, it has been relatively easy for 
Kenya to monitor the implementation of the recommendations of TCA as en-
shrined in the public health policy. Of great importance in the act are the find-
ings through research, monitoring of progress and assessment of the dangers of 
tobacco abuse and tobacco quitting strategies [13].  

Research findings from various studies on tobacco use paints at a rapid in-
crease in tobacco use among the young people [13]. The increase was marginal 
in the boy child but significant in the girl child [8]. Remarkably, adults were re-
ported to start smoking immediately they attain adolescent age [14]. Adults who 
start smoking at younger age tend to have ill health and are prone to diseases re-
lated to heavy tobacco smoking [15]. Government agencies such as the National 
agency for the campaign against drug abuse (NACADA), international re-
searchers and non-government organizations and agencies such as the world 
health organization (WHO) and the centre for disease control, and preven-
tion(CDC)have done several researches on tobacco use among a country’s pop-
ulation as well as in special groups such as students and women [8]. The Kenyan 
situation analysis by the Kenya tobacco situation analysis (KTSA) which was 
done between 2008 and 2010 revealed that the country has not put enough effort 
in tobacco control, enforcement and follow up of the current tobacco legislation 
policies [16]. In another study which was conducted in 2011 with the sole aim of 
assessing the progress made by the government in the implementation of the 
Frame Work Convention on Tobacco control (FCTC) and the implementation 
of the Tobacco Control Act (TCA) of 2007 [17]. The study reported that signifi-
cant steps were taken into account during the implementation of the programs. 
Unfortunately, most activities were taken up by the health ministry with little 
participation from other Government ministries [15]. Limitation of incomes and 
industry meddling were mentioned as blockades to progress in tobacco control 
and cessation [12]. 

2. Methodology 

In this review, published articles, technical reports and various survey findings 
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from the ministry of health were considered. Information was also obtained 
from the internet by doing a search using advanced Google scholar, Web of 
Science, Sci-Finder and Cochrane literature search engines. These sources were 
chosen because they were wide-ranging and contained up to date reports from 
studies conducted in Kenya and around the world. Moreover, direct searches 
from open access journals were also explored. The search items included the 
combinations: “Kenya and smoking”, “Smoking cessation”, “Kenya tobacco pol-
icy” and “tobacco abuse in Kenya”. Titles of the articles were read in order to 
identify those whose studies focused on the Kenyan situation analysis. Abstracts 
were also reviewed; articles whose abstracts focused on tobacco use, use of to-
bacco products, smoking cessation strategies were included in this study. More 
than 150 articles were reviewed out of which 50 articles were found to be suitable 
for this review. Articles were eligible for review if they were in English origi-
nal-surveys and/or research papers and focused on the scope of tobacco abuse in 
Kenya, legislative policy on tobacco abuse and economic consequence of tobacco 
use, and health related aspects. Studies conducted between 2000 to date were 
captured in this review. Additional articles for inclusion were identified by 
searching the references of the eligible articles. The search for eligible articles 
yielded articles in English in order to minimize challenges arising from language 
barriers. 

The authors read through all the articles or research findings from the search 
on the internet meticulously. Those articles that contained irrelevant or insuffi-
cient information were discarded or excluded. Relevant articles were individually 
assessed by the authors. The key emphasis was to ensure that all articles to be 
considered met the important inclusion criteria. Individual author’s opinion on 
articles’ eligibility was sort by convening a meeting of authors to ensure a critical 
review. Decisions were based on inclusion criteria such as the scope of the study, 
composition of participants, interventions, and expected outcome. Disparities in 
authors’ judgements were fixed through discussion and compromise mechan-
isms. The flow diagram presented in Figure 1 outlines the steps taken in choos-
ing the articles for this review article. 

Out of the 24 articles reviewed, two were studies on tobacco abuse by youth, 6 
were articles on tobacco cessation mechanisms and cessation challenges. The 
technical reports and surveys reviewed were three (3); Tobacco, promotion and 
sponsorship (TAPS), International tobacco control (ITC) Kenya, Kenya Demo-
graphic Health Survey (KDHS) and Global adult tobacco survey (GATS). Three 
were on state of tobacco use in Kenya. The remaining eleven articles focussed on 
tobacco consumption and related health implications (Table 1 and Table 2). 
The article extracted mainly included; sample size, location or region of partici-
pants, sample size, age of the respondents and their smoking characteristics of 
respondents. Initial search yielded 150 articles, 100 of these articles were re-
moved because they were found to be duplicated. After scanning the titles and 
abstracts, a further 19 articles were excluded. After reading the full texts of the 
remaining articles 24 articles were found to fully meet eligibility criteria.  
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Figure 1. Flow chart of literature search. 

 
Table 1. Statistics on tobacco consumption in Kenya. 

Author Region of study Design Age Incidences of tobacco use population 

[21] Nairobi Tobacco smoke 12 - 17 31% 1130 

[5] Nairobi Tobacco smoke Mean 16.7 32% 5311 

[13] National Tobacco smoke 13 - 15 21.2% 6768 

[8] National Products of tobacco 14 - 23 18.3 458 

[22] Eldoret Cigarette use 18 - 32 42.8% 500 

 
Table 2. Incidence of tobacco abuse. 

Author 
Region of 

study 
Design Age 

Percentage incidences 
of tobacco abuse 

Sample  
population 

[15] National Tobacco smoke average 16.7 10.5% 5311 

[6] National Tobacco smoke 13 - 15 8.2% 6768 

[23] National Tobacco products 15 - 49 19% 18,503 

[24] Nairobi Tobacco smoke Pupils 12.1% 281 

[25] Rural Products of tobacco Children 3.8% 800 

[26] National Products of tobacco 15 - 65 9.1% 2580 

3. Results 

Studies indicate that smoking prevalence among the Kenyan adult population 
shot up from 6.6% in 2001 [18] to 18% in 2008 [19]. Of more concern, however; 
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are the findings of similar studies conducted among students in the country 
which indicate an exponential increase in smoking prevalence from 8.2% in 2007 
to 58% in 2012 [18]. The above situation has led many scholars to endeavour to 
understand the factors that have culminated to the increase in smoking preva-
lence among the younger generation [18]. Doubts have been cast on the effec-
tiveness of taxation policies on tobacco abuse [20]. 

3.1. The Kenyan Status on Tobacco Use 

The prevalence of tobacco is reported in Table 1. All studies were conducted 
within a population of ages between 12 and 32. Two of the studies had national 
representative sample while one study investigated the use of tobacco products 
while other three studies explored the impacts on cigarette abuse. 

Incidences of tobacco use were found to range from 3.8% - 19% (Table 2). 
The studies revealed that the prevalence of tobacco consumption was higher in 
urban area than in rural area [15]. This review showed that three quarters of 
previous studies focused generally on tobacco abuse. 

Most of the studies included in this review were cross-sectional surveys. The 
focus of three studies was generally on substance abuse without necessarily 
dealing on tobacco abuse. KDHS survey focussed generally on the health status 
[27] whereas most of the studies considered tobacco control and the general 
consumption tobacco abuse. Three studies were conducted by the government 
and therefore had national representative surveys on tobacco use [28]. The glob-
al youth tobacco survey (GYTS) focused on tobacco abuse specifically on matters 
concerning publicity health and exposure to tobacco promotion, attitudes and 
insight into tobacco use, and quitting [18]. Two of the national studies, however; 
did not focus on tobacco use [15]. Besides, the three studies used different age 
groups therefore making comparison impossible. Majority of the studies were 
conducted among the younger population. This underscored the facts in litera-
ture that tobacco use probably begins at the tender age [25]. Such studies are 
more popular because of the ease of conducting school based surveys than 
community based surveys [27]. Similarly, findings from school based surveys are 
more reliable than household studies [21]. 

3.2. Tobacco Control Act (TCA) 2007 

The TCA was passed by the Kenyan legislatures in 2007 despite opposition from 
tobacco companies. The main purpose of the act was to control the production, 
labelling of tobacco as a dangerous substance and promotion of tobacco cessa-
tion [13] [29]. The Act explains the role the Kenyan government in the control 
of cigarette sales and consumption of tobacco related products in the country. 
This Act is divided into seven parts [17]. Part three of the act describes the need 
to disseminate information and educate the public regarding the addictive na-
ture and health threats caused by smoking [15]. The primary focus of the educa-
tion component in the act is to reach out to the family as well as in schools and 
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other institutions of learning on the dangers of tobacco abuse [30]. Part four of 
the act aims at controlling the sale of tobacco products in the Kenyan mar-
ket—this includes barring trading in or distribution of tobacco products to any 
person below the age of 18 and also bans the sale of single stick cigarettes [9]. 
Part six of the tobacco control act protects the public from involuntary exposure 
to tobacco smoke by prohibiting smoking in all public places [29]. Despite the 
enactment of the TCA, most of its specifications are yet to be fully enforced and 
no one has been prosecuted for violating the act. The delay in the implementa-
tion of the TCA legislation has been mainly attributed to the resistance of to-
bacco companies to conform to the specifications outlined in the act, as well as 
the laxity on the part of the government to enforce the law [1]. Moreover, the 
judicial system in Kenya has not been keen to prosecute any offenders acting in 
contravention of the act. Due to these lapses in implementation of the act, con-
sumption of tobacco has persisted and is sharply increasing among Kenyans of 
all ages, gender and social status [25]. 

3.3. The Health Sector in Kenya with Respect to Tobacco Smoking 

According to the Kenya health policy 2012-2030, health is one of the key com-
ponents of delivering the Vision’s social pillar given the key role it plays in 
maintaining a healthy and skilled workforce necessary to drive the economy 
[31]. The Kenya government unfortunately spent a huge budget of approx-
imately 34.7 bn KES for the 2013/2014 financial year for preventive and curative 
health services and a large portion of this was spent on the non-communicable 
diseases (NCDs) [17]. The total health expenditure per capita was US$27 while 
the government health expenditure was 5.2% of total budget in 2016 [31]. 31% of 
the total health expenditure was provided by donors although Kenya is yet to 
reach the 15% of the GDP to be used on health as agreed in the Abuja conven-
tion of 2010 [32]. Tobacco use is a risk factor which either increases the risk or 
causes most of the NCDs [9]. A decade ago, tobacco accounted for almost 6 mil-
lion deaths every year (including over 600,000 deaths from exposure to second 
hand smoke) and was projected to increase to 8 million deaths annually by 2030 
[16]. Tobacco use is ranked second with 9% of global deaths attributed to it 
(CDC, Global Youth Tobacco Surveillance, 2000-2008) [21]. Centers for disease 
control and prevention (CDC) conducts global adult tobacco survey (GATS) in 
all the countries every 4 years to check the situation in every country with re-
spect to tobacco use and cessation [16]. GATS is the global standard to syste-
matically monitor adult tobacco use and track key tobacco control indicators 
[16]. GATS is a national representative household survey of persons above 15 
years of age that uses a standard protocol [20]. The intention of GATS is to gen-
erate comparable data within and across countries [16]. GATS enhance coun-
tries’ capacity to design, implement and evaluate tobacco control interventions 
[16]. GATS has been carried out in a number of countries in Africa including 
Egypt, Nigeria and Kenya [9]. According to the Kenyan fact sheet, it was found 
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out that 15.1% of the current tobacco users were men with only 0.8% being 
women [20]. The overall former daily tobacco smokers were found to be 28.5% 
implying that over a quarter of the Kenyan population is either using tobacco or 
have previously used tobacco and/or tobacco related products [30]. 

3.4. International Tobacco Control (ITC) Kenya Survey 

The ITC Kenya Survey data suggest that tobacco use has increased based on the 
Kenya Demographic Health Survey (KDHS) conducted between 2008 and 2009 
which found that 19% of men and 1.8% of women were to baccousers [15]. The 
ITC Survey conducted in 2012 found that 16% of adults in Kenya—27% of 
which were men and 5% women were consumers of tobacco products [33]. To-
bacco use prevalence ranged from 9% in Western and Nyanza provinces to 26% 
in Coast province [33]. The types of tobacco products used differed among men 
and women—the majority of male tobacco users (83%) mainly use smoked to-
bacco products (primarily cigarettes) while female tobacco users (66%) mainly 
use smokeless products [26]. The majority of Kenyan cigarette smokers use fac-
tory-made cigarettes (87%) whereas 12% smoke hand-rolled cigarettes and the 
rest 1% smoked both forms of cigarettes [30]. More than one-third (40%) of Ke-
nyan smokers have “ever” tried to quit smoking cigarettes, and 17% of smokers 
planned to quit in the next 6 months [6]. Concern for serious tobacco illnesses 
such as cancer and respiratory diseases informed the decision to quit cigarette 
smoking for good. Smokeless tobacco users were even less likely to have at-
tempted to quit—about one-fifth (21%) of smokeless users have tried to quit 
[34]. The two most common reasons advanced for the desire to quit smokeless 
tobacco were the same as those for smokers [31]. Of concern is the finding that 
the price of cigarettes and smokeless products were among the least frequently 
cited reasons influencing quitting [5]. Tobacco users in Kenya are not well con-
nected to information about tobacco cessation assistance [9]. One-fifth (20%) of 
tobacco users reported that they had visited a doctor or some health provider in 
the last 6 months [6]. Among smokers who had visited a doctor, 35% were given 
advice to quit tobacco—a lower percentage than in most of the other ITC low 
middle income countries (LMICs) [9]. It is well established that advice to quit 
from a physician or health provider is a powerful precursor towards achieving 
tobacco cessation [5]. Of those who were given advice to quit, 82% reported that 
the advice made them ponder seriously about quitting tobacco [6]. 

3.5. The Kenya Demographic and Health Survey (KDHS) 

The Kenya demographic and health survey (KDHS) measured tobacco use 
among a nationally representative sample of adults in 2003 and repeated the 
survey in 2008-09 period [30]. In the KDHS, adult men and women were asked 
whether they smoked cigarettes or used any other tobacco products [19]. The 
survey findings showed a decrease in all types of tobacco use among men aged 
between 15 - 49 years from 25% in 2003 to 19% in 2008-09 periods [19]. Ciga-
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rette smoking among males also decreased from 23% in 2003 to 18% in 
2008-2009 [15]. Among women, tobacco use of any kind continued to be low at 
less than 3% in 2003 and less than 2% in 2008-09 [30]. Rates of cigarette smok-
ing among women remained the same in both surveys; at less than 1%. In 
2008-09, the highest cigarette smoking prevalence rate was among men aged 45 - 
49 (29.6%) [19]. Male respondents who were more educated and who were in 
the highest wealth quintile were less likely to smoke [30]. Conversely in 2003, 
men with no education were less likely to smoke and those in the lowest and 
middle wealth quintiles were less likely to use tobacco products [15]. In both 
surveys, men with no education had the highest rate of using other tobacco 
products besides cigarettes or pipes (15.8% in 2003 and 18.3% in 2008-09) [18]. 
In 2008-09, Central province of Kenya had the highest rate of male cigarette 
smokers (30.4%), while in 2003 Eastern province had the highest rate of male 
cigarette smokers (37.1%) [35]. Nyanza province had the lowest rate of smoking 
among men at 7.9% in 2008-09 and 11.0% in 2003 [15]. 

3.6. The Global Adult Tobacco Survey (GATS) 

The global adult tobacco survey (GATS), a nationally representative survey of 
adults across countries was conducted in Kenya in 2014 [36]. The survey found 
that the prevalence of any tobacco use among men has remained the same at 
19% since the survey was conducted between 2008 and 2009 by KHDS [30]. The 
rate of cigarette smoking among men had declined slightly, from 18% in 2008-09 
to 15% in 2014 [36]. Tobacco use among women increased slightly from less 
than 2% in 2008-09 to 4.5% in 2014 although cigarette smoking among women 
remained the same at less than 1% [36]. GATS found that the majority of adult 
Kenyan tobacco users were smokers. Accordingly, 61% of tobacco users used 
smoked tobacco, 33% used smokeless tobacco while 6% were hybrid users [22]. 
The majority of smoked tobacco users were men (72%) whereas 16% were 
women and 83% of smokeless tobacco users were women while 21% were men 
[36]. 

3.7. Tobacco Cessation and Its Benefits 

Smoking cessation refers to discontinuation of smoking or inhalation of tobacco 
products or quitting smoking for good [37]. Tobacco cigarette smoking is a 
medical condition that is normally considered chronic and if not properly ma-
naged, may results to a greater chance of relapsing [38] [39]. Most smokers are 
aware that smoking is harmful although many have tried more than once to at-
tempt to quit [40]. Regrettably, above 80% of those who attempt to stop tobacco 
smoking find themselves relapsing to the same smoking habits [41] [42]. There 
are many associated benefits in quitting tobacco smoking; notably, improved 
health and reduced risk commonly associated with tobacco smoking diseases 
[43]. Quitting smoking is a slow process that involves stepwise consistent reduc-
tion of the urge to smoke; it is not an instant abstinence, but the benefits are 
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immediate and possibly realized in less than a month after quitting [38]. Quit-
ting smoking has benefits such as reduction of risk of diseases such as cancer of 
the oesophagus and lung cancer [44]. Smoking has been found to decrease life 
expectancy. Life expectancy is reported to be enhanced by smoking cessation 
[37]. It is thus of critical significance that smokers get access to smoking cessa-
tion interventions and treatment. This encourages people to stop smoking and 
therefore exploit the smoker’s probabilities of abandoning cigarette smoking 
successfully [43]. 

3.8. Interventions for Tobacco Cessation 

Smoking cessation can be achieved through telecoms, media, and technology 
(TMT)-based interventions, behavioral or pharmacological interventions [9]. 
Behavioral interventions when used together with medication yields a high rate 
of successful smoking cessation [45]. Behavioural interventions involve counsel-
ling sessions by health providers as well as providing routine advice and consul-
tations which are provided resourcefully to smokers [43].  

Pharmacological interventions are a combination of two pronged mechanism 
include both nicotine based and non-nicotine based medications [43]. Nicotine 
replacement therapies (NRTs) are a pharmacological method that is normally 
approved by food and drug administration (FDA) [45]. NRT is known to exist in 
the following forms; nicotine patches, chewing gums, nasal sprays, inhalers and 
tablets [34]. The sole objective of NRT is to replace nicotine obtained from ciga-
rette smoking and therefore lower the urge to smoke therefore making quitting 
cigarette smoking relatively easy [45]. Apart from NRT, other non-nicotine me-
dications involve the use of bupropion or varenicline which have proved quite 
effective [34]. Bupropion has been found to lessen the desire to smoke cigarettes 
in clinical trials [43]. Bupropion works by inhibiting dopamine re-uptake into 
neuronal synaptic vesicles in nucleus accumbens [45]. Varenicline has been re-
ported to be very effective and its mechanism of action involves stimulating and 
blocking of nicotinic receptors in the brain [46].  

Price-based policy measures used by most governments include raising taxes 
on tobacco products [9]. Studies have shown that 10% increases in tax on ciga-
rette price reduce smoking occurrence by between 4% and 8% [37]. It is also re-
ported that public benefits from tobacco tax remain positive only when tax rates 
are in the range 42.9% and 91.1% [13].  

4. Discussion 

The deliberate use of mass media to deliver campaign messages against cigarette 
smoking as well as health consequences of tobacco smoking is effective in re-
ducing smoking prevalence [15]. Telecommunication and technology based in-
terventions are becoming popular in disseminating cautionary messages against 
smoking. They are effective and widely used due to their universal reach and low 
implementation costs. Online campaign have also proven to be more cost effec-
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tive than other media, though doubts are cast on its effectiveness in reducing 
smoking prevalence especially among the illiterate population [9]. Framework 
convention on tobacco control (FCTC) is the world’s first most successful public 
health treaty established by WHO to fight the global tobacco menace through 
various measures that include advocacy for reduction of tobacco demand and 
supply through control of tobacco pricing and taxation, advocacy for smoke-free 
policies, packaging and labelling of tobacco products, tobacco advertising and 
sponsorship, cessation and treatment, illicit trade and sales of tobacco products 
to minors.  

Statistics from various surveys in Kenya show a rapid surge in tobacco use 
predominantly among the youth. The increase was reported to be even more 
prevalent in girls as compared to boys [8]. It is reported that most adults who 
smoke started as teenagers [47]. Those persons who start smoking at tender age 
eventually become heavy smoker at the adult age. The consequence of this is ill 
health especially from ailments related to cigarette smoking. Several studies 
have established that exposure to cigarette smoking causes a number of ail-
ments that includes coronary ailments, cancers and chronic lung diseases [33]. It 
well-known that smokers are more likely to have ill health than non-smokers 
because they spent most of their time seeking treatment resulting to a greater fi-
nancial burden than non-smokers [48].  

The families of heavy smokers are accordingly subjected to economic stress 
when smokers are hospitalized and thus resources will have to be mobilized to 
meet medical bills [9]. The economic productivity of smokers also deteriorates 
due to nonattendance to productive engagements and economic losses in meet-
ing direct medical costs [9]. The suffering due to pain, distress and low quality of 
life are other indiscernible costs that cannot be quantified. Scientific statistics 
reveal that chronic diseases contribute about 50% of all hospital admissions in 
Kenya [18]. They are also reported to cause over 30% of total deaths [9]. Smok-
ing related diseases overstretches the health system that is also overburdened by 
communicable diseases [31]. Continued use of tobacco will worsen this state in 
future because tobacco associated diseases continue to occur and may become 
resistant to medications [9].  

Tobacco business is counter-productive to the health status of a country. It is 
estimated that for every dollar earned from tobacco revenue, three dollars are 
used to mop up tobacco related ailments [31]. For instance, Kenya gathers about 
5 billion shillings every year as tobacco proceeds but ends up susing 15 billion 
shillings to treat tobacco related diseases in the country [17]. Tobacco farming 
and production is a rigorous agricultural practice especially in terms of labor. 
Studies have revealed that tobacco farming apart from being labor intensive af-
fects the educational levels of girls their nutrition and general reproductive 
health of women. This is because girls and women labor are extensively used in 
tobacco production [17]. Tobacco farming degrades soil productivity. It has de-
trimental effects on the environment consequently hence causing reduction in 
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food productivity and thus food insecurity. This frustrates government’s efforts 
to eradicate poverty [23]. Tobacco farming causes serious destruction of biodi-
versity, fertilizers and chemicals used to spray tobacco plants cause deadly envi-
ronmental impacts [23]. Similarly, wood is used as fuel when curing tobacco 
leaf—this is a deadly precursor for forest destruction by deforestation thus lead-
ing to reduction in forest cover [8].  

Tobacco control legislation attempts to discourage or stop people’s exposure 
to cigarette smoke in the community through its prescribed programs. This pre-
vents the young people from indulging into the network of smokers. Legislation 
therefore enhances tobacco cessation efforts thereby increasing the chances of 
quitting tobacco use by tobacco users. People’s health will thus improve and 
health inequalities will increase [6]. Tobacco smoking largely contributes to the 
already widening gap in life expectancy among a country’s population [14]. 
Therefore, it important to target the socially disadvantaged persons in the socie-
ty when designing tobacco control programs [17].  

The World health organization framework convention on tobacco control 
(WHOFCTC) encompasses six policy measures, currently known as MPOWER 
which is an abbreviation for monitor, protect, offer, warn, empower and 
raise—monitoring tobacco use and interventions, protecting people from tobacco 
smoke, offering help to quit tobacco use, warning against the dangers of tobacco, 
enforcing bans on tobacco advertisements, tobacco promotion and sponsorship 
(TAPS), raising taxes on tobacco, and other tobacco supply-reduction measures, 
including developing sustainable alternatives to tobacco-growing, controlling il-
licit trade and regulating tobacco products which are intended to assist in the 
implementation of effective interventions with the primary focus of reducing the 
demand and supply of tobacco products at the country level [16]. Presently, over 
2.3 billion people in 92 countries are subscribing at least one of the MPOWER 
measures [16]. In Kenya, despite the enactment of the tobacco control act of 
2007, the prevalence of tobacco abuse keeps rising at an alarming rate and has 
massively been regarded as one of the main public health concerns [49]. 

An assessment of the implementation of tobacco control policies in Kenya was 
carried out by WHO in 2011 [16]. The goal of the assessment was to look at the 
status of the implementation of tobacco control measures and assess the Kenyan 
capacity to implement the provisions of the framework convention on tobacco 
control (FCTC) [15]. The findings of this study was consistent with those of pre-
vious studies with found out coordination among the players in tobacco control 
has been missing [47]. Measures such as use of pictorial cautions in cigarette 
packets had also not been implemented [15]. Nevertheless, there has been sub-
stantial development in studies on the monitoring of implementation of the 
FCTC and the TCA [17]. Moreover, there is steadiness in the obstacles that deter 
operative implementation of tobacco control policies [44]. These include tobac-
co industry meddling and lack of organization mechanism among government 
agencies that are concerned with drug abuse [31]. As a result of the wide-ranging 
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nature of the TCA and FCTC, no study gave details on a precise provision for 
the execution of tobacco cessation strategies [15]. Nonetheless, none of the stu-
dies highlights the effectiveness of the FCTC and TCA on tobacco use and to-
bacco associated health impacts [31]. These developments have made it neces-
sary to change from studies that monitor progress to studies that evaluate the 
impact of implementation of tobacco control act (TCA) and other tobacco ces-
sation strategies [17].  

In this review, there are two studies that researched on tobacco, promotion 
and sponsorship (TAPS) from two diverse standpoints [16]. The first looked into 
the sources of pro and anti-tobacco exposure messages in primary school going 
children [35]. This study was done before the enactment of the tobacco control 
act that banned TAPS. The study established that tobacco publicity was a risk 
factor in cigarette smoking [35]. The second study was conducted over a period 
of two years focussed media monitoring concerning tobacco, promotion and 
sponsorships (TAPS). Notwithstanding the establishment of the TCA, it revealed 
that the tobacco industry was dubious techniques to circumvent the established 
laws that prohibit unconventional means to encourage people to smoke [15]. In 
2007, a study was conducted to examine the support tobacco control policies 
gets from the public and to assess how the findings could be used as a catalyst to 
the legislative process especially the establishment of tobacco control law in the 
country [15]. This formed the best examples of employing scientific studies to 
inform policy. This study and its findings were instrumental in the passing of the 
tobacco control act (TCA) by the Kenyan parliament [26]. Studies on policy are 
vital because they provide evidence to the tobacco industry against tobacco con-
trol [9]. Evidence-based policy adoption is important inreducing the burden re-
lated with tobacco use more so in the world’s poorest economies [50]. 

Strength and Limitations of the Study 

 This study has provided tobacco abuse situational analysis in Kenya, pro-
vided statistics on tobacco smoking and the efforts the government has put in 
place to control tobacco abuse. This paper therefore can form a point of ref-
erence on matters tobacco abuse in Kenya and may apply to other countries 
of similar experience.  

 Most of the articles did not qualify for use in this review because they had no 
relevance to the Kenyan context and were therefore excluded. The articles 
might have had critical information on tobacco use but failed to capture the 
scope and relevance of tobacco abuse and cessation strategies in Kenya. 

 It is evident from this review that few studies have been conducted on tobac-
co abuse and measures undertaken to promote tobacco cessation in Kenya.  

 This review article makes detailed exposition on the major gaps in policy im-
plementation towards curbing tobacco control and abuse in Kenya. 

 Despite the passing of the TCA in 2007 and the ratification of FCTC, tobacco 
abuse in Kenya is still alarming. 
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5. Conclusion 

This review article has established that although the Kenya government has 
made some strides in the control of tobacco abuse, the prevalence is still very 
high. The formulation of the tobacco control act of 2007 and the ratification of 
FCTC in 2004 were key steps towards tobacco control and promotion of tobacco 
cessation but these have not realized significant progress so far. On the contrary, 
more youth and adults have been recruited into cigarette smoking and tobacco 
abuse. Ailments arising from tobacco use have significantly burdened the 
economy in terms of medication and loss resulting from death as well as impo-
verishment of a large portion of the Kenyan population courtesy of tobacco 
abuse and tobacco related diseases such as cancer. The health care providers 
have done little in terms of providing smoking cessation interventions especially 
pharmacological and counseling interventions. Lack of these services coupled 
with intermittent mass media campaigns against tobacco use has made quitting 
rates very low. Studies on the psychological effects of tobacco consumption in 
Kenya and the health consequences of tobacco smoking are rare. This review 
study therefore has identified gaps in tobacco research in Kenya that may be 
beneficial towards tobacco cessation. 
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